
updated 6-17-20

# Category Description Vendor Price Units Brand Order # Notes

1 Toilet Paper
 1 Ply 4"x4.5" x 1500' roll - 

1.75" core - 48rolls/case
WB Mason $33.35cs. 48/cs. Alliance Alic405201

2 Toilet Tissue
Toilet Tissue White 4.5x3.75"  

500 sheet/roll 96/case
WB Mason $23.23cs. 96/cs. Alliance Alic423750e

3

Toilet Tissue 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

MorCon MorSoft Millennium 2 

ply Toilet Tissue 750 sheets 

48/case

Mansfield $35.42 48 Morcon #027

4 Toilet Tissue
Jumbo Roll - 1 ply - 3.5 x 2000 

ft. - 12 rolls/case
WB Mason $19.32cs. 12cs. Alliance Alic420001

5
Urinal Screens & 

Blocks
SSS Triples 12/case Pyramid $10.99 CASE/12 IMPACT 9480S

6
Toilet Bowl 

Cleaner

Freedom II Bowl Cleaner Non 

Acid 12/32 oz. 
Top Notch $15.05 12/CS CREATIVE C-71

7

Toilet Bowl Swab 

with Squeegee 

Tube

Toilet Bowl Swab with 

Squeegee Tube - Impact 3600 

- each

Pyramid $1.29 EA IMPACT 3600

[Alternative]

Mastermans
$0.76 1 Tolco XWH-TO-280100

8
Wax Bags - 

Sanitary Napkins

9 x 10.5 inch - specify number 

per box
Top Notch $14.92 500/cs HOSPECO HOS260

9 Facial Tissue
White 2 ply 100 sheets/box-

30/case
WB Mason $11.75cs. 30bx/cs. Crystalware CSWT1002P30

10
Floor Stripper- 

non rise

Buckeye Ripsaw Floor Stripper 

- 5 Gallon Box
Top Notch $21.76 5GAL CREATIVE BULLSEYE5

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$21.90/PL 5 GAL PAIL NCL NCL105020

11

Floor Stripper- 

non rise

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Enforcer No Rise Wax Stripper 

- SSS 48109 - 2/2.5 gal per 

case

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$21.90/PL 5 GAL. PAIL NCL NCL105020

12

Floor Stripper 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Simonize Release - 5 Gallon 

Pail
Mansfield $21.60 5gal Simoniz Release

13

Floor Stripper 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Flash 55 Floor Stripper - 

Pioneer - AMD516FS - 5 

Gallon

WB Mason $65.24cs. 2/2.5gal/cs. Pioneer AMNFS516

14

Stripping Pad 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

20"Americo - specify units per 

case
Mansfield $11.20cs. 5/cs Americo 400119

15

Stripping Pad 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

20" 3M 7200 - 5/case Mastermans $31.62 5 3M 7200-20

16

Floor Finisher

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Omni Guard Floor Finish - 

Pioneer - AMN141FS - 5 

Gallon

WB Mason $69.33cs. 2/2.5gals/cs. Pioneer AMN141FS

17 Floor Cleaner

BETCO - Fastdraw 1 PH7 

Ultra - 17847-00 - 

Box of (4) 2 Liter Containers

WB Mason $72.18CS. 4/gals/cs. Betco BCC1784700

18 Floor Polish

Gelcon Polish - Essential 

Industries - 207FR - 2 

Quarts/Case
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19
Floor Wax  25% 

Solid

Castleguard Metal Cross 

Linked Floor Finish - 5-gallon 

box

[Alternative]

Top Notch
$41.40 5GAL TOP NOTCH TNFF25

20

Floor Wax 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Wet Look Floor Wax Plus - 

Simonize - CSO750 - 5 gallon
Mansfield $36.85 5gal Simonize Wet-Look

21 Wax
Sta-Brite Square Pail - 5 gallon 

pail 
Top Notch $49.75 5GAL STA-BRITE SBFF5

22

Floor Buff

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Gelcon - Floor Buff - #207FR

23 Carpet Shampoo
Steam Plus Carpet Shampoo - 

gallon - specify units/case
WB Mason $7.99ea. each/gal NCL NCL066029

24

Carpet Shampoo

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Automatic Shampoo - SSS - 

48007 - 4 Gallons/Case

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$33.00cs. 4/gals/cs. NCL NCL067029

25  Hand Sanitizer  
1000 ml - 6/case - includes 

dispenser at no charge
Mastermans $32.23 6 DEB SBS SBS-56827

[Alternative}

WB Mason
$32.71cs. 6/1000MIL/CS NCL NCL044557

26
Foaming Hand 

Soap

1000 ml - 6/case - includes 

dispenser at no charge
WB Mason $26.10cs. 6/1000MIL/CS NCL NCL043157

Maybe delays in 

shipping due to current 

circumstances

[Alternative]

Mastermans
$41.47 6 DEB SBS SBS-AZU1L

27

Foaming Hand 

Soap

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Kutol - Kut686L05 - 6/case WB Mason $28.96cs. 6/1000MIL/CS Kutol Kut686l05

28

Foaming Hand 

Soap 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

1000ML - Kutol - KUT69041 - 

specify units/case
WB Mason $28.96cs. 6/1000MIL/CS Kutol KUT69041

29

Hand Sanitizer 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Purell - GOJ0215608 - each WB Mason $60.69cs. 8/CS GOJO GOJ215608CT

30

Hand Sanitizer 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Purell - 1200ml-LTX - GOJO-

1904- 2/pack
Mastermans $76.00 2 Gojo GOJ190402CT

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$49.39cs. 2/cs. GOJO GOJ190402CT

Sold by case of 12 Gojo 

IS CURRENTLY OUT OF 

STOCK

31 Hand Sanitizer 
Purell NXT - Refill - Pur2137-

12 - 12/case
Mastermans $86.05 8/case Gojo GOJ213708CT

32 Disinfectant

Betco Fastdraw 2 AF79 - Con - 

#33147-00 - 

4-2 Liter Bottles per case

WB Mason $61.35cs. 4/2ltr/cs. Betco BCC3314700
Maybe delays in 

shipping due to current 

circumstances

33
Lysol Spray 

Disinfectant
19 oz. - 12/case Mastermans $83.49 12 Lysol JNL-4650

[Alternative]

Mastermans
$28.75 CASE/12 CHASE 433-4104

 **20oz CAN** 

(KILLS COVID-19 

& MORE)

34

Pine Sol 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

144 oz. Lemon or Orange 

Cleaner specify units per case
WB Mason $27.33cs. 3/144oz/cs. Clorox/pinesol CLO35419CT.

No Bids Received

No Bid as Specified

No Bid as Specified
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35 Bleach
 Gallon - specify units/case 

and Brand Bid
Mastermans **$13.20

Bid $2.20 for each 

- sold 6/case
KIK 11006755042

36 Bleach
 Gallon - specify units/case 

and Brand Bid
WB Mason $14.34cs.  6/gals/cs. Purebrite KIK11008635042

37 Glass Cleaner 19 oz. aerosol can Mansfield **$23.16

Bid priced $1.93 

for each sold by 

doz - 20 oz

Zenex 495205

38

Glass Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

SSS Glass Cleaner Spray - 

19oz - 12/case - #21002

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$25.80CS. 12/19OZ/CS NCL NCL2002

39

Multi Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

2 Liter - Multi Cleaner - Heavy 

Duty - 3m - #2u674
Mastermans $307.93 6 3M MMM2L

40

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Super Court Cleaner - BONA - 

BNAM70001818 - 1 Gallon
WB Mason $41.03cs. 4/gals/cs. Bona BNAWM700018187

sold by the case of 4 

gals.

41

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Pretreat Concentrated Extract - 

SSS - 48070 - 4 Gallon/case

42

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Betco Fastdraw 10 - Citrus 

Chisel - #16747-00 - 

4 Gallons/case

WB Mason $59.76cs. 4cs. Betco BCC1674700

43

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Betco Fastdraw 

SPECTACULOSO - 2L

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $45.44cs. 4/cs. Betco BCC10234700

44

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Betco Best Scent - Ocean 

Breeze - #BCC2314700

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $140.90cs. 4/cs. Betco BCC2314700

45

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Betco Green Earth Peroxide 

Cleaner - #BCC3364700

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $71.16cs. 4/cs. Betco BCC3364700

46

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

SHA-ZYME Deororizer - 

Restroom Cleaner - Gallon - 

No-Rinse - #1831

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $10.57 GALLON/EACH NCL NCL183129

47

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

 Sha-Zyme - Heavy Duty 

Cleaner - Gallon -  

#NCL508124 

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $11.85 GALLON/EACH NCL NCL508124

48

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

3M NEUTRA Cleaner - 

#3M20200 Twist N Fill

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

Mastermans $8.95 6 3M MMM3H

49

Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

NCL Sha-Zyme Grease Attack 

/ Anti Slip / Deodorize Bio-

Cleaner - 1 Galon - 4/Case - 

#NCL183029

WB Mason $38.31cs. 4/cs. NCL NCL183029

50

Air Freshener

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

SSS Baby Powder Dry - 10oz 

12/case - #05030

51

Air Fresh / 

Deodorizer

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

SSS Disinfectant Deodorant - 

16.5 oz - 12/case - #05003

No Bid as Specified

No Bids Received

No Bids Received

No Bids Received
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52

Disinfectant / 

Deoderant

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

NCL Fortress Spray 

Disinfectant Deodorant - 

1.15OZ Aresol #NCL2004

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $37.12cs. 12/15OZ NCL NCL2004

53

Disinfectant

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

SSS DC Plus 2 Detergent 

Disinfectant RTU, 1 qt., 

12/case - #13409

54

Bowl Cleaner

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Betco Kling Thick Bowl 

Cleaner - 32oz - MNT-

Wintergreen Scent - 

#BCC0751200

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason $1.83ea. each Betco BCC0751200

55 Clorox Wipes 75/container Mansfield **$29.52
Bid $4.92 each - 

sold 6/cs
Clorox CLO15949

56

Disinfectant 

Wipes

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen 

Peroxide Wipes - 155 count - 

6/case

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$15.49ea 160/PK/CAN New Sani NWLWIPESANI605Z

Alcohol Sanitizing 

wipes lead-times may 

vary

57

#11 Dual Blend 

Sha-Zyme 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

NCL-508124 - 4/case WB Mason $43.47cs. 4/cs. NCL NCL508124

58 Trash Bags 24”x 32”, 1 ml - 500/case UniPack $12.20 500 UPC 33R

59 Trash Bags 38" x 58" 2 ply, 2 ml -100/case UniPack $13.30 100/cs UPC 60XHD

60

Trash Bags 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

38x60 - 2ML Trash Liner - 

Central Poly - CP38602M

Central Poly-

Bag
$18.90 100/CS Central Poly CP38602M updated 6/17/20

61 Trash Bags 33" x 39" 1.5 ml -100/case
All American 

Poly
$8.33 100/case

All American 

Poly
3339XH-AAP

62 Trash Bags
33" x 40"  16 mic Liner  

Natural 250/case

Central Poly-

Bag
$13.60 250 Central Poly CP3340N16

63 Trash Bags 24”x 33”, 8 mic - 1000/case UniPack $14.50 1000/CS UPC HD33

64 Trash Bags 40"x48" 16 mic - 250/box
Central Poly-

Bag
$15.90 250 Central Poly CP404816

65 Trash Bags
Heavy Duty 32 gal. 30" x 37" -

500/case
UniPack $11.90 500 UPC HD37

66

Scouring 

Sponges - Green 

Backing

Box - 20/box Pyramid $10.99 BOX/20 HYDRA 70CHD-20

67
Stripping Pads - 

Black
3M - 3M08275 - 5/case Pyramid $12.99 CASE/5 ACS 72-20

68

Burnishing Pads

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

#86000460 24" burnishing 

pads (only pads that fit 

propane burnisher)

[Vendor please indicate # of if 

sold per case]

69

Ice Melt- Low 

Damage 

Vegetation

50 pounds - bags WB Mason $7.76/bag 50# bag Meltco MELMT42964

70

Ice Melt - 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Purple Flame - 50 lbs. - SSS - 

CS531

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$8.59bag 50# bag Kissner kismerlinbag

71
Powder Free Non 

Latex Gloves
100 pair/box - 10 boxes/case Pyramid $33.90 CASE 10/100 TRADEX V5201-size

72
Powder Free Non 

Latex Gloves

100 pair/box - 10 boxes/case 

Size XXL
Pyramid $43.90 CASE 10/100 TRADEX VXXL5201

No Bids Received

No Bid as Specified

No Bids Received

No Bid as Specified
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73
Paper Towels - 

Natural

Baywest  # 31300 - 6 rolls/800 

ft. - NOTCHED

[Alernative]

WB Mason
$20.94cs. 6/cs. Alliance ALICNK800

74
Paper Towels - 

Natural

8" x 600' roll -2" core - 12/case 

- NOT NOTCHED
WB Mason $23.96cs. 12/cs. Alliance ALIC9K600

75 Paper Towels
8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT 

NOTCHED
WB Mason $14.35cs. 6/cs. Alliance ALIC9K800

76
Paper Towels - 

White

8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT 

NOTCHED
WB Mason $17.72cs. 6/cs. Alliance ALIC8B800

77

Paper Towels 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Hardwound Kraft Towels - 

#HVN410097 - 600' - 12/case
WB Mason $29.20cs. 12/cs. Sofidel HVN410097

78

Paper Towels 

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Bounty - 2 ply - 8/pack Mastermans $9.85 8 Bounty PGC75721

79

Standard Paper 

Towel Dispenser 

w/Lever

2 in. core - for 625' roll WB Mason $12.50ea. each Sofidel HVN410203

80

Paper Towel 

Dispenser

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Georgia-Pacific Hygienic Push 

Paddle Paper Towel 

Dispenser - Translucent 

Smoke - #5338

WB Mason $21.39ea. EACH Georgia Pacific GPC54338

81

Paper Towel 

Dispenser

[NO 

SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

PT - Bumper Bar Dispensers - 

#HVN410203
WB Mason $12.50ea. each SOFIDEL HVN410203

82 Neutral Cleaner

2.5 Gallon Containers

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

WB Mason **$57.84
Bid  $4.82 for 

each/gal
NCL NCL093529 sold by case of 12

83

Degreaser - 

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Kaivac Kalplow - Kaival - KDG

[Vendor please indicate # of 

bottles if sold per case]

84
Glass Cleaner 1 Gallon container (4 per case)

Mastermans $11.34 4 KES KESWINDOWPLUS

85

Mop Blue/White Finish Wet Mops

Pyramid **$45.48
Bid $3.79 each - 

sold case of 12
ABCO LM203MCSNB 

**12 EA/CS…FULL 

CASES ONLY**

86

Mop

Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x24 - 

each

WB Mason **$38.16
Bid $3.18 each - 

sold case of 12
ABCO ABODMTL13524WEA sold by case of 12

87

Mop

Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x36 - 

each

Pyramid **$79.08
Bid $6.59 each - 

sold case of 12
NEXSTEP 96937

**12 EA/CS…FULL 

CASES ONLY**

88

Mop

Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x48 - 

each

Pyramid **$82.68
Bid $6.89 each - 

sold case of 12
NEXSTEP 96949

**12 EA/CS…FULL 

CASES ONLY**

89 Wet Mop

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

End Finish Wet Mop Heads - 24oz 

- Blue - 5" Headband - #RLBV0476

[Vendor please indicate # of if 

sold per case]

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$4.45ea. each ABCO ABOCLM303LWB

No Bids Received

No Bid as Specified

No Bid as Specified
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90 Wet Mop

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

End Finish Wet Mop Heads - 20oz 

- White - 5" Headband - 

#RLBV04354

[Vendor please indicate # of if 

sold per case]

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$3.58ea. each ABCO ABOLM2001LW20

91
Industrial Web 

Foot Wet Mop 24 oz - 12/pack
Top Notch $42.61 12/case Janico LMOP24

92

Gloves - Powder 

Free 

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS] Nitrile - M - 100 pack

Mastermans $3.57 100 Sempermed GNI-GSNF-MD

93

Gloves - Powder 

Free 

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS] Nitrile  - LG - 100 pack

Mastermans $3.57 100 Sempermed GNI-GSNF-LG

94

Gloves - Powder 

Free 

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS] Nitrile - XLG - 100 pack

Mastermans $3.57 100 Sempermed GNI-GSNF-XL

95
Gloves - Powder 

Free LG - 100 pack
Mastermans $1.84 100 Safety Zone GVY-GVP9-HH-LG

96
Gloves - Powder 

Free XLG - 100 pack
Mastermans $1.84 100 Safety Zone GVY-GVP9-HH-XL

97
Plastic Spray 

Bottles 32oz - plastic spray bottles - each
Pyramid $0.51 EA IMPACT

5032WG **BOTTLE 

ONLY**

98
Plastic Spray 

Bottles 32oz - trigger spray bottles - each
Mansfield $0.78 ea Impact 5779trig

99
Rest Room Cleaner 

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Kaivac Kaiblooey Restroom 

Cleaner - KBLG

[Vendor please indicate # of if 

sold per case]

Simplex $76.00 CS4 1GAL KAIVAC CBK205

100

Lobby Dust Pans

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS] Rubbermaid - RCP2531
Pyramid $9.98 EA RUBBERMAID 2531

101
HAND SOAP

[NO SUBSTITUTED 

ITEMS]

Alfia - Foaming Hand Soap  - 

#0431-57

[Vendor please indicate # of if 

sold per case]

[Alternative]

WB Mason
$4.35ea. EACH NCL NCL043157

No Bid as Specified

No Bid as Specified
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