
Bid # Item Unit Size Unit Winning Vendor Price Unit Brand Order Number Notes

1 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Buff --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM BOISE CASMP2201BF

2 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Blue --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201BE

3 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Pink --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201PK

4 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Green --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201GN

5 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Canary --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201CY

6 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Goldenrod --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201GD

7 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Purple --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM BOISE CASMP2201OR

8 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Salmon --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM MASON WBM22201SN

9 Duplicating Paper 8 1/2 X 11 - Gray --- Ream WB Mason $3.58 RM BOISE CASMP2201GY

10 Card Stock - 110lbs - asst. color- 8 1/2x11 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.94 PK SPRINGHILL

SPHL025300 - Blue    

SPHL035300 - Canary    

SPHL055300 - Buff    

SPHL056300 - Ivory    

SPHL075300 - Cherry    

SPHL085300 - Salmon

11 Card Stock - 110lbs - WHITE - 8 1/2x12 250/PKG Package WB Mason $6.72 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL015300

12 Coverstock - 8.5x11 - 65lb - Blue - Springhill [#SPHL014052] 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.83 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL014052

13 LUX CARD STOCK 11X17 - SUNFLOWER 50/PKG Package Quill $21.65 50/PKG Lux 2146802LUX

14 Multipurpose Paper - 60lbs - 8 1/2 x 11 - Red 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $6.22 RM. BOISE CASMP2241RY

15 Cover Stock - 65lbs - Canary 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.83 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL014051

16 Cover Stock - 65lbs - Blue 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.83 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL014052

17 Cover Stock - 65lbs - Pastel Blue 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.83 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL014052

18 Cover Stock - 65lbs - Pink 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.83 PK SPRINGHILL SPHL076000

19 Cover Stock - 65lbs - White 250/PKG Package WB Mason $7.97 PK HAMERMILL HMM188560

20 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Lime 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $6.22 RM BOISE CASMP2241LE

21 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Lemon 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $6.22 RM BOISE CASMP2241LN

22 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Pink 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $8.88 RM NEENAH WAU45266

23 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Orange 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $8.88 RM NEENAH WAU45207

24 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Green 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $6.22 RM BOISE CASMP2241ED

25 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Yellow 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $8.88 RM NEENAH WAU45282

26 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Aqua --- Ream WB Mason $6.22 RM BOISE CASMP2241AA

27 Fluorescent Colored Copy Paper - 8.5x11 - Violet --- Ream WB Mason $8.88 RM NEENAH WAU22081

28 Copy Paper 20# - 8 1/2 X 11 - White --- Ream WB Mason $2.72 RM MASON WBM21200

29 Copy Paper 20# - 8 1/2 X 14 - White --- Ream WB Mason $3.71 RM MASON WBM24200

30 Copy Paper 20# - 11 X 17 – White 500/REAM Ream WB Mason $6.13 RM MASON WBM28110

31 Drawing Paper 80# - 12 X 18 - White 500/PKG Package WB Mason $13.49 RM PACON PAC4812

32 Drawing Paper 80# - 18 X 24 - White 500/PKG Package WB Mason $26.99 RM PACON PAC4818

33 Drawing Paper 60# Light Weight - 9 X 12 - White --- Ream WB Mason $5.18 RM PACON PAC4709

34 Drawing Paper 60# Light Weight - 12 X 18 - White --- Ream WB Mason $11.13 RM PACON PAC4712

35 Drawing Paper 56# - 9 X 12 - Manila --- Ream WB Mason $4.52 RM PACON PAC4209
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36 Construction Paper - 12x18 - Holiday Green 100/pk Pack WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC8008

37 Construction Paper - 12x18 - Gray 100/pk Pack School Specialty $2.23 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506535

38 Construction Paper 9x12 - Christmas Red 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.45 100/PKG. PACON PAC9904

39 Construction Paper 9x12 - Spectral Orange 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.31 100/PKG. PACON PAC6604

40 Construction Paper 9x12 - Spectral Yellow 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.09 100/PKG. PACON PAC8404

41 Construction Paper 9x12 - Spectral Green 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC8004

42 Construction Paper 9x12 - Holiday Green 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC8004

43 Construction Paper 9x12 - Spectral Blue 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC7404

44 Construction Paper 9x12 - Sky Blue 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC7604

45 Construction Paper 9x12 – Brown 100/PKG Package School Specialty $1.24 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506492

46 Construction Paper 9x12 - Warm Brown 100/PKG Package School Specialty $1.25 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506494

47 Construction Paper 9x12 – Black 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.16 100/PKG. PACON PAC6304

48 Construction Paper 9x12 - Assorted 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.14 100/PKG. PACON PAC6504

49 Construction Paper 9x12 – Violet 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC7204

50 Construction Paper 9x12 – White 100/PKG Package School Specialty $1.10 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506511

51 Construction Paper 9x12 - Light Green 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC8104

52 Construction Paper 9x12 – Pink 100/PKG Package WB Mason $1.07 100/PKG. PACON PAC7004

53 Construction Paper 9x12 – Gray 100/PKG Package School Specialty $1.10 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506509

54 Construction Paper 12x18 - Gray 50/PKG Package WB Mason $1.05 50/PKG PACON PAC8807

55 Construction Paper 12x18 - Slate Gray 50/PKG Package WB Mason $2.27 50/PK PACON PAC103060

56 Construction Paper 12x18 - Christmas Red 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.86 100/PKG. PACON PAC9908

57 Construction Paper 12x18 - Spectral Orange 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.55 100/PKG. PACON PAC6608

58 Construction Paper 12x18 - Spectral Yellow 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC8408

59 Construction Paper 12x18 - Spectral Green 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC8008

60 Construction Paper 12x18 - Light Green 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC8108

61 Construction Paper 12x18 - Spectral Blue 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC7408

62 Construction Paper 12x18 - Sky Blue 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC7608

63 Construction Paper 12x18 – Violet 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.08 100/PKG. PACON PAC7208

64 Construction Paper 12x18 – Brown 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.28 100/PKG. PACON PAC6708

65 Construction Paper 12x18 - Warm Brown 100/PKG Package School Specialty $2.47 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506521

66 Construction Paper 12x18 – Black 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.28 100/PKG. PACON PAC6308

67 Construction Paper 12x18 - Assorted 100/PKG Package WB Mason $2.49 100/PKG. PACON PAC6508

68 Construction Paper 12x18 - White 100/PKG Package School Specialty $2.23 PACK OF 100 SUNWORKS 1506537

69 Construction Paper 12x18 - Rose    100/PKG Package Cascade $2.95 100/pk ideal paper 115978/pink

70 Construction Paper 18 X 24 - White 50/PKG Package School Specialty $2.67 PACK OF 50 SUNWORKS 1506556

71 Construction Paper 18 X 24 – Black 50/PKG Package WB Mason $2.57 50/PKG. PACON PAC6317

72 Parchment Paper - 24# - Gray - Southworth 500/Box Box WB Mason $25.96 500/BX SOUTHWORTH SOU974C

73 Comp Paper 8 X 10 1/2 - W/Margin 3/8 Ruling Short Way - White --- Ream WB Mason $2.31 RM. PACON PAC2431

74 Comp Paper 8 X 10 1/2 - No/Margin 3/8 Ruling Short Way - White --- Ream WB Mason $2.31 RM. PACON PAC2433

75 Comp Paper 8 X 10 1/2 - No/Margin 1/2 Ruling Long Way - White --- Ream WB Mason $2.54 RM. PACON PACL24312211

76 Comp Paper 8 X 10 1/2 - No/Margin 3/8 Ruling Short Way - Yellow --- Ream Cascade $2.80 rm american pr. 109392

77 White Lined Paper - 8 1/2 x 11 --- Ream WB Mason $2.54 RM. PACON PAC2401

78 Yellow Lined Paper - 8 1/2 x 11 --- Ream Cascade $3.34 rm americam pr. 109393

79 Arithmetic Paper 6 X 9 - White --- Ream Cascade $1.57 rm american pr. 109626

80 Arithmetic 8 X 10 1/2 - White --- Ream Cascade $2.73 rm american pr. 109627
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81 Drawing Paper - 60# 9 X 12 - White --- Ream WB Mason $5.14 RM. PACON PAC4709

82 Graph Paper - 8 1/2 x 11 - 1/4" Rule --- Ream WB Mason $2.78 RM. PACON PAC2411

83 Graph Paper - 8 1/2 x 11 - 1/2" Rule --- Ream WB Mason $3.81 RM. PACON PACL00778002211

84 Graph Paper 8 ½ x 11 1/8” rule --- Ream Cascade 9.37 rm american pr. 111276

85 Chart Paper, Padded, White Bond  - 24 X 32 - 1 Inch Ruling One Side --- Each Cascade 3.00 each american pr. 166393

86
Chart Paper, Padded, White - 24 X 32 - Unruled - Unpunched - [Vendor - 

indicate # of pages in pad]
100 Sheets Each WB Mason $2.39

25 

SHTS./PAD
PACON PAC74510

87 Easel Paper - Not Sticky - 27x34 --- 2 Pack WB Mason $11.40 2/CTN. TOPS TOP7903

88 Story Paper Pad - 24x36 Ruling Short Way 100 sheets per pad --- Pad Cascade $9.78 EACH PACON 109786

89 Restickable Easel Pads 25x30, Plain White --- Each Cascade $17.70 EACH 3M 113217

90 Oak tag 9 X 12 Med Weight 125 Lb 100/Pkg Package WB Mason $2.04 100/PKG. PACON PAC5181

91 Oak tag 12 X 18 Med Weight 125 Lb 100/Pkg Package WB Mason $4.10 100/PKG. PACON PAC5184

92 Oak tag 18 X 24 Med Weight 100/Pkg Package WB Mason $8.23 100/PKG. PACON PAC5190

93 9x12 Tag Paper - Assorted Colors 100/Pkg Package WB Mason $2.62 100/PKG. PACON PAC5171

94 9x12 Tag Paper - White 100/Pkg Package WB Mason $1.88 100/PKG. PACON PAC5231

95 Poster Board - 20"x26" (Coated One Side) --- Each

96 Rainbow Colored Kraft Paper, lightweight, 36"x1000' - Orange Roll Roll WB Mason $36.27 Roll PACON PAC63100

97 Rainbow Colored Kraft Paper, lightweight, 36"x1000' - Dark Blue Roll Roll WB Mason $30.92 Roll PACON PAC63180

98 Rainbow Colored Kraft Paper, lightweight, 36"x1000' - Green Roll Roll WB Mason $40.21 Roll PACON PAC63130

99 Rainbow Colored Kraft Paper, lightweight, 36"x1000' - Yellow Roll Roll WB Mason $36.27 Roll PACON PAC63080

100 Rainbow Colored Kraft Paper, lightweight, 36"x1000' - Red Roll Roll WB Mason $32.72 Roll PACON PAC63030

101 Tissue Paper, Assorted Colors - Kolorfast [#214947] --- Package Cascade $7.41 pkg hygloss 115266

102 Preschool Certificate - 8.5x11 - Trend #T-17006 [NO SUBS] 30/Pkg Package Cascade $3.07 30/pk trend 034984

103 Steno Pads --- Each WB Mason $0.41 EACH UNIVERSAL UNV76620

104 One Subject - 8 x 10 1/2 - (side spiral) notebook 140 Pages Each Cascade $0.75 140pg cascade 030608

105 Examination Books - 7 X 8 1/2  12 Pages Stapled 50/Pkg Each WB Mason $4.35 EACH PACON PACBB7812

106 Composition Books #16 - 7 X 8 1/2  40 Pages -  Stapled Sold as Each Each School Specialty $0.18 EACH SCHOOL SMART 002043

107 Composition Books #16 - 7 X 8.5 - 48 Pages -  Stapled Sold as Each Each WB Mason $0.23 EACH PACON PACMMK37121

108 Composition Notebook - 9 3/4" X 7 1/2", Wide Margin Ruled, Black 120 Sheets Each Cascade $0.54 each pacon 110312

109
Hard Cover - Marble Composition Book - 

[VENDOR - indicate # of pages and size]
--- Each WB Mason $0.49 EACH PACON PACMMK37118

9 3/4 x 7 1/2 - 120 

sheets

110 Sentence Strips – Manila 100 SHT/PKG Package WB Mason $1.22 PKG. PACON PAC5157

111 Sentence Strips - Assorted Colors 100 SHT/PKG Package WB Mason $1.51 PKG. PACON PAC73400

112 Spiral Notebooks - 8x10.5 70 SHEETS Each School Specialty $0.71 EACH SCHOOL SMART 085267

113 Mini-Legal Pads - 3x5 - White 3/pack pack School Specialty $1.15 PACK OF 3 ROARING SPRING 087158

114 Note Pads - 8.5 x 11 - White 12/Pack Pack WB Mason $5.16 PKG. MASON WBM10630

115 Legal Pads - White 8 1/2 X 11 3/4 
 12/Pack Pack WB Mason $5.16 PKG. MASON WBM10630

116 Legal Pads - Yellow 8 1/2 X 11 3/4 - 
 12/Pack Pack WB Mason $5.16 PKG. MASON WBM20630

117 Laminating Film 1.5 Mil 25" X 500 Roll --- Each Scott $13.10 Each Hop 25" x 500'

118 Laminating Film 3.0 Mill 25" X 250 Roll 1" CORE Each Scott $15.50 Each Hop LR-3X25/250Y

119 Laminating Pouches - Letter Size - 9 x 11.5 - Scotch Thermal 100/Box Box Scott $6.22 Box Hop P309

120 Laminating Pouches - 8.1x11.4 - Scotch #TP33854-200 [NO SUBS] 200/Box Box WB Mason $23.28 200/BX 3M MMMTP3854200

121 Desk Calendar, 16 Month, 22" X 17" --- Each Cascade $1.99 each roaring spgs 120088

122 Desk Calendar - At-A-Glance - AAGE41750 [NO SUBS] --- Each WB Mason $13.88 Each AT-A-GLANCE AAGE41750

No Bid
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123 Class Record Books 9-10 Weeks 8 1/2 X 11 --- Each School Specialty $1.37 EACH HAMMOND AND STEPHENS 1481868

124 Plan Master #2 K12 - 8 1/2 X 11 3/4 Red --- Each Cascade $2.73 each elan pub. W101 017215

125 Record Book Extra Large Blocks --- Each WB Mason $2.69 EACH ELAN ELANEXCELLO

126
Appointment Book - 14-Month, Jul. - Aug., Academic/Fiscal - 8-1/4 X 10-

7/8, Black
--- Each Cascade $11.01 each doolittle 029987

127 Envelopes - Plain White #6 500/box Box Cascade $8.81 500/bx std.envelope 120325 - 6 1/4

128 Envelopes - Plain White #10 500/box Box WB Mason $7.83 BX MASON WBM35210

129 Envelopes - Plain White #10 - Window 500/box Box Cascade $8.85 500/bx std.envelope 120343

130 Envelopes - Report Card - 6 x 9 - Kurtz #17097 [NO SUBS] 500/box Box

131 Clasp Envelopes - Kraft - #55 Size 6 X 9 100/box Box WB Mason $4.48 BX. MASON WBM35260

132 Clasp Envelopes - Kraft - #90 Size 9 X 12 100/box Box WB Mason $6.26 BX. MASON WBM35264

133 Clasp Envelopes - Kraft - #97 Size 10 X 13 100/box Box WB Mason $7.19 BX. MASON WBM35267

134 Brown Kraft Envelope - 12x15 50/box Box School Specialty $19.17 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 085056

135 Envelope Moistener w/Adhesive - Quality Park #46065 [NO SUBS] 12/pkg Package WB Mason $15.60 12/pk Q.PARK QUA46065-DZ

136 Index Cards - White 4 X 6 Ruled 100/pkg Package School Specialty $0.59 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 088710

137 Index Cards - White 4 X 6 Unruled 100/pkg Package School Specialty $0.59 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 088712

138 Index Cards - White 5 X 8 Ruled 100/pkg Package School Specialty $0.82 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 088713

139 Index Cards - White 3 X 5 Ruled 100/pkg Package School Specialty $0.39 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 088706

140 Index Cards - White 3 X 5 Unruled 100/pkg Package School Specialty $0.37 PACK OF 100 SCHOOL SMART 088708

141 Index Cards - Assorted Bright Colors - 3 X 5 - Ruled 100/pkg Package Cascade $0.64 75/pk cascade 108787/ neon

142 Sticky Notes - Yellow 1.5 X 3 --- Dozen WB Mason $0.88 DOZ. 3M MMM6539YW

143 Sticky Notes - Yellow 3 X 3 --- Dozen WB Mason $1.75 DOZ. 3M MMM6549YW

144 Sticky Notes - Yellow 3 X 5 --- Dozen WB Mason $2.78 DOZ. 3M MMM6559YW

145 Sticky Notes - Yellow Lined 3 X 5 --- Dozen Standard $4.41 DZ BEAUTONE 11401

146 Sticky Notes - Assorted Colors 3x3 --- Dozen Standard $1.77 DZ BEAUTONE 11039

147 Sticky Pop Up Notes - (accordion style) --- Dozen WB Mason $2.34 DOZ. 3M MMM6549PUY

148 Telephone Memo Pads --- Dozen WB Mason $1.99 DOZ. UNIVERSAL UNV48023

149 Laminated Folder - Twin Pocket - Blue - Oxford [#51705] 25/Box Box School Specialty $12.46 PACK OF 25 OXFORD 1372196

150 Laminated Folder - Twin Pocket - Red - Oxford [#51705] 25/Box Box School Specialty $12.46 PACK OF 25 OXFORD 1372198

151 Laminated Folder - Twin Pocket - White - Oxford [#51705] 25/Box Box School Specialty $12.46 PACK OF 25 OXFORD 029540

152 File Folders - PURPLE - Third Cut - Letter Size 100/BOX Box School Specialty $5.72 PACK/ 100 SCHOOL SMART 085105

153 File Folders Manila - Third Cut - Letter Size 100/BOX Box WB Mason $4.25 BX. MASON WBM12113

154 File Folders - Assorted Colors - Third Cut - Letter Size 100/BOX Box Cascade $6.50 100/bx cascade 022977

155 File Folders - BLUE - Universal [#UNV10501] 100/BOX Box Cascade $6.50 100/bx cascade 121639

156 File Folders - YELLOW - Universal [#UNV10504] 100/BOX Box Cascade $6.50 100/bx cascade 121641

157 File Folders - GREEN - Universal [#UNV10502] 100/BOX Box Cascade $6.50 100/bx cascade 121640

158 File Folders - RED - Universal [#UNV10503] 100/BOX Box Cascade $6.50 100/bx cascade 121638

159 Hanging File Folders - 1/5 Letter Size - Green 25/BOX Box WB Mason $3.88 BX. MASON WBM14115

160 Labels, Address - [AVERY 5160] [NO SUBS] 3000/BOX Box National Art $22.36 BOX AVERY 5160

161 Labels, [AVERY 5163] [NO SUBS] 1000/Box Box National Art $24.20 BOX AVERY 5163

162 Labels, [AVERY 5164] [NO SUBS] 100/BOX Box National Art $24.54 BOX AVERY 5164

163 Labels, [AVERY 5168] [NO SUBS] 100/BOX Box WB Mason $25.03 BX. AVERY AVE5168

164 Labels, [AVERY 5263] [NO SUBS] 25/pkg Package WB Mason $7.31 BX. AVERY AVE5263

165 Labels, [AVERY 5353] [NO SUBS] 100/Box Box WB Mason $25.83 BX. AVERY AVE5353

166 Labels, [AVERY 8293] [NO SUBS] 400/Box Box Quill $10.75 400/Box Avery 8293UNI 

No Bid
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167 Address Labels, Dymo - #DYM30251 [NO SUBS] Roll Roll School Specialty $6.81 PACK OF 2 DYMO 038587

168 Pocket Folders Duo – Assorted 25/Box Box Cascade $2.81 25/bx cascade 028160

169 Pocket Folders Duo Blue 25/Box Box School Specialty $2.61 PACK OF 25 SCHOOL SMART 084899

170 Pocket Folders Duo Red 25/Box Box School Specialty $2.61 PACK OF 25 SCHOOL SMART 084895

171 Pocket Folders Duo Yellow 25/Box Box School Specialty $2.61 PACK OF 25 SCHOOL SMART 084897

172 Pocket Folders Duo Green 25/Box Box School Specialty $2.61 PACK OF 25 SCHOOL SMART 084894

173 1" Binders W/ Plastic Insert Window On Front White Each WB Mason $1.08 EACH AVERY AVE05711

174 1 1/2" Binders W/ Plastic Insert Window On Front White Each Cascade $1.25 each cascade 015797

175 1 1/2" Three Ring Binder BLACK Each Cascade $1.19 each cascade 005470

176 Binder, Standard 3 Ring Vinyl - 1/2 Inch, 8 1/2 X 11 BLACK Each WB Mason $0.99 EACH AVERY AVE03201

177
Binder, Standard 3 Ring Vinyl - One Inch, 8 1/2 X 11 - 

State Color On P.O.
--- Each Cascade $0.97 each cascade 118889

178 Binder 2” with plastic front insert --- Each Cascade $1.54 each cascade 150005

179
Binder, Standard 3 Ring Vinyl - Two Inch, 8 1/2 X 11 - 

State Color On P.O.
--- Each WB Mason $1.36 EACH AVERY

AVE03500 - Blue    

AVE03301 - Black

180 Binders 3” with plastic front insert --- Each WB Mason $1.99 EACH AVERY AVE05741

181 Binder, Standard 3 Ring Vinyl - Three Inch, 8 1/2 X 11 BLACK Each Quill $1.73 Each Quill 739551

182 Binder, Standard 3 Ring Vinyl - Fourt Inch, 8 1/2 X 12 BLACK Each WB Mason $3.97 EACH AVERY AVE09800

183 Binder Dividers - A To Z --- Package School Specialty $1.23 EACH SCHOOL SMART 081939

184 Binder Dividers - Insertable - Colored Tab 5 TAB SET Package Standard $0.18 PK PREMIER 5A

185 Binder Dividers - 5 Tab - Avery - [#AVE11110] [NO SUBS] 5 TAB SET Package Quill $0.44 5 TAB SET Avery 11110Q 

186 Binder Dividers - 8 Tab - Avery - [#AVE11111] [NO SUBS] 8 TAB SET Package Quill $0.66 8 TAB SET Avery 11111Q 

187 Binding Combs 1/2" 100/box Box Standard $3.07 BX HOP PB1/2

188 Binding Combs 5/8" 100/box Box Standard $4.34 BX HOP PB5/8

189 Binding Combs 1" 100/box Box Cascade $6.44 50/bx hop indust. 022114

190 DYMO self-adhesive file folder labels (30277) [NO SUBS] 9/16 by 3 7/16 Pkg. WB Mason $7.57 PKG. DYMO DYM30277

191 DYMO self-adhesive address labels (30572) [NO SUBS] 1 1/8 x 3 ½ Pkg. School Specialty $16.45 PACK OF 520 DYMO 1480381

192 5 Tab Binder Dividers 5 TAB SET Package Standard $0.18 PK PREMIER 5C

193 Sheet Protectors - Top Loading 100/BOX Box Standard $2.27 BX PREMIER 41294

194 Binder Clip - 2"W - 1" Capacity - Large 12/BOX Box Standard $0.87 BX GENERAL BC100

195 Binder Clip - 1 1/4"W - 5/8" Capacity - Med 24/BOX Box WB Mason $0.41 BOX UNIVERSAL UNV10210

196 Binder Clip - 3/4"W - 3/8" Capacity - Small 40/BOX Box Standard $0.16 BX GENERAL BC20

197 Stikki Clips (E-Z Up Clips) – reusable paper holders 20/Box Box Standard $1.87 BX RESTICK CLIP RSC20

198 Metal Book Rings, ACCO 72202  - 1" Diameter 100/BOX Box Cascade $1.61 100/bx cascade 028860

199 Brass Fasteners - 1/2" - Kurtz #11426 [NO SUBS] 100/BOX Box

200 Brass Fasteners - 1" 100/BOX Box Standard $0.57 BX GENERAL #4

201 Brass Fasteners - 2" 100/BOX Box Standard $1.18 BX GENERAL #7

202 Thumb Tacks 100/BOX Box Standard $0.19 BX STANDARD TT2

203 Paper Clips  - #1 Gem - Smooth - (100 per box - 10 box per pack) --- Box WB Mason $0.19 BOX UNIVERSAL UNV72210BX

204 Paper Clips - Jumbo - Smooth - (100 per box - 10 box per pack) --- Box WB Mason $0.45 BOX UNIVERSAL UNV72220BX

205 Rubber Bands 1/4 Lb Asst. --- Box WB Mason $0.55 BOX UNIVERSAL UNV00454

206 Staple Remover – Claw --- Each Standard $0.18 EA STANDARD 32002

207 Stapler --- Each School Specialty $1.37 EACH SCHOOL SMART 038178

208 Staples – Standard 5000/BOX Box Standard $0.41 BX STANDARD STBC

209 Staples - Standard - Chisel Point - 1/4" 5000/BOX Box WB Mason $0.49 BOX UNIVERSAL UNV79000

210 Kid Scissors - 5" Pointed - Assorted - Westcott [NO SUBS] 4/Pack Pack School Specialty $0.61 EACH WESTCOTT 1464910

No Bid
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211 Kid Scissors - 5" Pointed - Fiskars - [NO SUBS] Each Each WB Mason $0.53 EA FISKARS FSK1055801001

212 Scissors - Clip Point - 5" --- Each School Specialty $0.68 EACH SCHOOL SMART 086339

213 Scissors - For Kids  Blunt Cut --- Each Standard $0.23 EA GENERAL E9416

214 Scissors - Blunt - 5" - Fiskars --- Each WB Mason $0.53 EACH FISKARS FSK1535201002

215 Scissors - Blunt - 8" - Fiskars --- Each National Art $1.58 EACH FISKARS 150220

216 Scissors -  8" --- Each Standard $0.45 EA EDGE E2000

217 Scissors - 8" Straight - Fiskars [#FSK01004761j] [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.90 each fiskars 030008

218 3 Hole Paper Punch - Manual - Counter Use/Size Medium Capacity --- Each Standard $2.42 EA STANDARD 1-Mar

219 Calculator paper rolls 2-1/4 X 150ft. roll WB Mason $0.41 ROLL UNIVERSAL UNV35710EA

220 Metal rim round key tags, white, 1 ¼ inch diameter 50/pack pack WB Mason $3.35 PK AVERY AVE11025

221
Metal Rim Key Tags, Card Stock/Metal - AVERY #AVE11025 

[NO SUBS]
50/pack pack WB Mason $3.35 PK AVERY AVE11025

222 Handheld Calculators (Approx. 4x5) Basic Function --- Each Cascade $0.98 each cascade 120125

223 Ruler - Plastic Metric - 1/16 Inch --- Each Standard $0.10 EA STANDARD 16220

224 Tape - Cellophane - 1/2 X 1296 - 1inch Core --- Each Standard $0.24 EA TAPEMATE 5000

225 Tape - Cellophane - 3/4 X 1296 - 1 Inch Core --- Each Standard $0.31 EA TAPEMATE 5100

226
Invisable Tape - .75"x36 yards - School Smart #1354292 

[NO SUBS]
12/Pack Pack School Specialty $12.15 PACK OF 12 SCHOOL SMART 1354242

227 Tape 3/4" - Clear - Transparent 6/Pack Pack Cascade $10.66 6/pk 3m 026143

228 Scotch Magic Tape 3/4" x 1000" [#MMM810P10K] [NO SUBS] 10/Pack Pack National Art $13.90 PACK 3M 810-34-10PK

229 Tape Dispenser --- Each Standard $0.70 EA STANDARD C38

230 Masking Tape - 1/2 Inch X 60 Yards --- Each Standard $0.40 EA EDGE E83-1/2

231 Masking Tape - Double Sided - 1/2 Inch X 60 Yards --- Each School Specialty $7.42 EACH SCOTCH 1457945

232 Masking Tape - 3/4 Inch X 60 Yards --- Each Cascade $0.69 each cascade 123191

233 Masking Tape - 1 Inch X 60 Yards --- Each Cascade $0.79 each cascade 123192

234 Masking Tape - 2 Inch X 60 Yards --- Each Standard $1.39 EA EDGE E83-2

235 Shipping Tape - 2" - --- Each Standard $0.48 EA CLEARSTICK PP-2-55

236 Painter/Low Tack Tape - 2" Roll Each Cascade $5.98 each 3m 022199

237 Magnetic Tape - 3/4"x25' w/tape dispenser - Dowling [#90052] "--- Each

238 Glue 4 OZ. Each Standard $0.32 EA STANDARD 4GA

239 Glue 8 OZ. Each School Specialty $0.84 EACH ELMERS 008970

240 Glue Stick .28 oz Each Standard $0.08 EA STANDARD S32

241 Glue Stick 1.3 oz Each School Specialty $0.27 EACH PRANG 024550

242 Elmers Washable All Purpose School Glue Sticks   (.21 oz) 30/pk Pack National Art $6.90 PACK ELMERS E514-30

243 Elmers Washable All Purpose School Glue Sticks   (.24 oz) 30/pk Pack School Specialty $7.96 PACK OF 30 ELMERS 081455

244 Correction Fluid - White --- Each Cascade $0.45 each cascade 108835

245 Bic White Out Correction Fluid 12/pk Pack Cascade $3.90 12/pkg cascade 026449

246 Correction Tape --- Each Standard $0.53 EA CORRECTOR TC983

247 Mechanical Pencil, .7mm DOZEN Dozen Standard $1.08 DZ CLICKSHARP 1004-7

248 Class Pack Wood Pencils - [Crayola [#CY0684240 240/Box Box National Art $25.90 BOX CRAYOLA 68-8024

249 Pencil w/erasers - Laddie DOZEN Dozen WB Mason $2.06 DZ DIXON DIX13304

250 Pencils #2 W/Erasers Kendal DOZEN Dozen WB Mason $0.56 DZ UNIVERSAL UNV55400

251 Pencil #2 Yellow Ticonderoga [NO SUBS] DOZEN Dozen WB Mason $1.28 DZ DIXON DIX13882

252 Pencil #2 Yellow Ticonderoga Woodcase [NO SUBS] DOZEN Dozen WB Mason $1.28 DZ DIXON DIX13882

253 Pencils #2 Pre-Sharpened W/Eraser (Orange) DOZEN Dozen School Specialty $0.56 PACK OF 12 SCHOOL SMART 084453

No Bid

School Supply Vendor Form 2019-2020 French River Education Center Page 6 of 9



Bid # Item Unit Size Unit Winning Vendor Price Unit Brand Order Number Notes

254 Pencil - Primer - For Beginners DOZEN Dozen Standard $1.20 DZ PRIMA 80

255 Pencils - Assorted Colors DOZEN Dozen Standard $0.57 DZ RAINBOW RITER 5012

256
Colored Pencil Class pack with Pencil Sharpeners  - Assorted 

Colors
240 Pack Package National Art $25.90 BOX CRAYOLA 68-8024

257 Crayola Colored Pencils 12/pk Pack WB Mason $1.13 ST. CRAYOLA CYO684012

258 Metallic Colored Pencils - Assorted Colors 12/SET Package School Specialty $1.25 SET OF 12 LIQUI-MARK 067630

259 Pencil Eraser - Pink - Med Size Beveled DOZEN Dozen Standard $0.37 DZ STANDARD G90

260 Pencil Eraser - Block Shape 1 Lb. Box 40/BOX Box Standard $1.12 BX EASYERASE G40

261 Papermate Arrowhead Eraser Caps 144/Box Box Standard $0.88 BX EASYERASE 7107

262 Pencil Sharpener - Boston --- Each WB Mason $7.42 EACH BOSTON EPI1031

263 Pencil Sharpener - Wood grain Electric --- Each WB Mason $15.58 EACH BOSTON EPI1800

264 Pencil Sharpener - Hand Held with Container --- Each School Specialty $0.12 EACH SCHOOL SMART 073689

265 Papermate Flair Assorted 16/Pack Pack Cascade $10.05 12/pk papermate 033360

266 Papermate Flair Felt Tip Pens - Medium Point 16/Pack Pack Cascade $10.05 12/pk papermate 033360

267 Pilot G-2 Retractable Gel-Ink Pen - Bold Point - Blue --- Dozen Quill $11.24 Dozen Pilot 31257Q 

268 Ball Point Pens Bic Round Stic - Fine Point - Blue --- Dozen WB Mason $0.93 DZ BIC BICGSF11BE

269 Ball Point Pens Bic Round Stic - Fine Point - Black --- Dozen WB Mason $0.93 DZ BIC BICGSF11BK

270 Ball Point Pens Bic Round Stic -  Medium Point - Blue --- Dozen WB Mason $0.93 DZ BIC BICGSM11BE

271 Ball Point Pens Bic Round Stic - Medium Point - Black --- Dozen WB Mason $0.93 DZ BIC BICGSM11BK

272 Ball Point Pens Bic Round Stic -  Medium Point - Red --- Dozen WB Mason $0.93 DZ BIC BICGSM11RD

273 Ball Point Pens Flexgrip Pen By Papermate - Medium Point- Blue --- Dozen National Art $6.69 DOZ PAPERMATE 96101

274 Ball Point Pens Flexgrip Pen By Papermate - Medium Point- Black --- Dozen National Art $6.69 DOZ PAPERMATE 96301

275 Ball Point Pens Flexgrip Pen By Papermate - Medium Point- Red --- Dozen National Art $6.69 DOZ PAPERMATE 96201

276 Ball Point Pens Flexgrip Pen By Papermate - Fine Point - Blue --- Dozen National Art $6.69 DOZ PAPERMATE 96601

277 Ball Point Pens Flexgrip Pen By Papermate - Fine Point - Black --- Dozen National Art $6.69 DOZ PAPERMATE 96801

278
Sharpie Oil Based Paint Medium Point Markers - Set of 2 - 2 Colors 

include: (1) Metallic Gold (1) Metallic Silver
--- Set School Specialty $3.02 PACK OF 2 SHARPIE 1446377

279 Sharpie Permanent Markers - Fine Tip - Black --- Each National Art $0.43 EACH SHARPIE 30001

280 Sharpie Permanent Markers - X-Fine Tip - Black --- Each National Art $0.44 EACH SHARPIE 37001

281 Sharpie Permanent Markers - S-Fine Tip - Black --- Each National Art $0.44 EACH SHARPIE 3700

282 Sharpies Fine  - Blue --- Each National Art $0.43 EACH SHARPIE 30003

283 Sharpies Fine - Red --- Each National Art $0.43 EACH SHARPIE 30002

284 Sharpies Fine - Green --- Each National Art $0.43 EACH SHARPIE 30004

285 Sharpie Marker Set [NO SUBS] 8/Pack Pack National Art $3.83 SET SHARPIE 30078

286 Flair Assorted Pens - Papermate [#PAP70644] [NO SUBS] 16/Pkg Package School Specialty $19.34 PACK OF 16 PAPERMATE 1603237

287 Marker Chisel Tip Assorted - EXPO - [NO SUBS] 16/Set Set WB Mason $9.37 ST. SANFORD SAN81045

288 Marker Chisel Tip Assorted - Sharpie - [#SAN38250] [NO SUBS] 8/Set Set WB Mason $3.89 ST. SANFORD SAN38250PP

289 Permanent Markers - Black --- Each Standard $0.11 EA MIGHTYMARK 10892

290 Permanent Markers - Chisel Tip - Assorted Colors per Set 8/SET Set Standard $1.06 ST MIGHTYMARK 10900

291 Washable Markers - Prang [#DIX80613] 200/Carton Carton School Specialty $36.13 SET OF 200 PRANG 221379

292 Uniblazer Highlighters - Assorted Colors 6/SET Set WB Mason $0.85 ST. UNIVERSAL UNV08860

293 Highlighters - Yellow --- Dozen Standard $1.34 DZ EMPHASIZER 814YW

294 Highlighters - Pink --- Dozen Standard $1.27 DZ EMPHASIZER 814OK

295 Highlighters - Orange --- Dozen Standard $1.27 DZ EMPHASIZER 814OR

296 Accent Tank Highlight - Sharpie - [#SAN25053] [NO SUBS] 12/Pkg Package Quill $5.53 Dozen Sharpie 25053
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297 Flip Chart Markers 4/SET Set Quill $2.63 4/SET SHARPIE 22474
Bullet Point, 

Water-based

298 Dry Erase Markers - Chisel Tip - Low Odor - Black --- Each Standard $0.20 EA WIZARD WB80-4

299 Dry Erase Markers - Bullet Tip - Low Odor - Black --- Each Cascade $0.28 each cascade 033054

300 Dry Erase Markers - Fine Tip 4 COLOR SET Set Standard $1.27 ST LIQUI-MARK 26040

301 Dry Erase Markers - Bullet Tip 4 COLOR SET Set Cascade $0.94 4/set cascade 032157

302 Dry Erase Markers - Chisel Tip 4 COLOR SET Set Standard $0.79 ST White Board Wizard WB80-4

303 Expo Markers - Assorted Colors 8/Pack Pack National Art $4.26 SET EXPO 80078

304 Expo Markers - Assorted Colors 12/Pack Pack Cascade $10.10 12/pk expo 033990

305 Expo Markers - Assorted Colors 16/Pack Pack School Specialty $11.68 SET OF 8 EXPO 026284

306 Dry Erase Markers – Pen Stle - Black Pack Standard $3.56 PK LIQUI-MARK 26001

307 Crayola Visi-Visi Max Dry Erase Marker - Black 12/Box Box WB Mason $7.49 DZ CRAYOLA CYO986012A051

308 Eraser For Dry-Erase Whiteboard --- Each Standard $0.27 EA STANDARD T104

309 Expo Cleaner - 8oz - [NO SUBS] WB Mason $1.49 EACH SANFORD SAN81803

310 White Board Cleaner 8 OZ. Each Standard $1.14 EA White Board Wizard 81803

311 Vis A Vis Fine Point Markers 4 COLOR SET Set Standard $1.30 ST LIQUI-MARK 1200-4

312 Crayola Classpack Markers, broad point, 16 colors [NO SUBS] 256/Box Box WB Mason $41.75 BX CRAYOLA CYO588201

313 Crayola Washable Markers, 8 Classic Color Set 8/SET Set National Art $1.76 SET CRAYOLA 58-7808

314
Crayola Trayola Washable Markers - Fine Tip - Pack of 48 - Assorted 

Colors 8 essential washable marker colors (6 markers per color) 

including Red, Orange, Yellow, Green, Blue, Violet, Black and Brown

48/PKG Package National Art $10.74 PKG CRAYOLA 7809-6

315 Wax Crayons - Crayola #38 - Kinder Size --- Box National Art $0.97 BOX CRAYOLA 52-0080

316 Wax Crayons - Crayola - 4 pack Pack Pack

317 Wax Crayons - Crayola #8 Standard - 8 Color --- Box National Art $0.37 BOX CRAYOLA 52-0008

318 Wax Crayons - Crayola #12 Standard - 12 Color --- Box WB Mason $0.69 PK CRAYOLA CYO520012

319 Wax Crayons - Crayola - 16 Colors --- Box WB Mason $0.71 BX CRAYOLA CYO520016

320 Class Pack Crayons Pack Pack Cascade $34.78 800/pkg dixon 182392

321 Class Pack Large Crayons Pack Pack School Specialty $31.48 SET OF 400 SCHOOL SMART 067254

322 Tempera Cake Sets - Jack Richeson [Vendor please indicate] 6 to 9/set Set School Specialty $2.85 SET OF 6 JACK RICHESON 1496094

323 Tempera Cake Single Colors - Jack Richeson [Vendor please indicate] 7 to 9/set Set School Specialty $4.38 SET OF 9 JACK RICHESON 1496096

324
Chromacryl 1/2 Gallon Tempera Paint 

[NO SUBS] - [Vendor indicate colors]
Each Each Cascade $14.70 each chroma 138342

325 Sargent Art Liquid Metal Acrylics [Vendor Indicate Colors] 8 OZ. Each School Specialty $22.60 SET OF 6 SARGENT ART 405594

326 Jazz Gloss Tempera [Vendor Indicate Colors] Pint Each

327 Prang Tempra Paints - White [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104865

328 Prang Tempra Paints - Green [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104862

329 Prang Tempra Paints - Blue [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104863

330 Prang Tempra Paints - Brown [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104866

331 Prang Tempra Paints - Red  [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104858

332 Prang Tempra Paints - Black [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104867

333 Prang Tempra Paints - Orange [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104859

334 Prang Tempra Paints - Pink [NO SUBS] --- Each

335 Prang Tempra Paints - Yellow [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104860

336 Prang Tempra Paints - Purple [NO SUBS] --- Each Cascade $1.25 each dixon 104864

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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337 Prang 8-Color Watercolor Paint set [NO SUBS] --- Each Standard $1.30 EA PRANG 292

338 Washable Paint - Gallon - Assorted Colors - Colorations Bottle Each School Specialty $5.08 EACH SCHOOL SMART see attached

339 Acrylic Paint - Chromacryl [NO SUBS] 1/2 Gallon Each School Specialty $10.16 EACH CHROMACRYL see attached

340 Camel Brush Assortment - Jack Richeson Set Set School Specialty $11.22 SET OF 60 JACK RICHESON 443483

341 Cray-Pas - Sakura - Assorted [NO SUBS] 12/Pack Pack School Specialty $2.55 SET OF 12 SAKURA 059196

342 Clay, Amaco Air Dry - 25# [#1383757] --- Each School Specialty $9.03 EACH AMACO 1383757

343 Clay, Modeling Dough - Classpack - Crayola [#CRY-23-600] --- Each National Art $24.14 EACH CRAYOLA 23-6001

344 Clay, Modeling Magic, White 2.2# - Plus Clay [#407305] --- Each Cascade $3.69 each crayola 025764

345 Feathers - Assorted - Creativity Street [#9-085936-458 --- Bag Cascade $1.05 pkg cascade 163022

346 Googley Eyes - 7.0m - Creativity Street [#407305] --- Bag School Specialty $0.39 SET OF 100 CREATIVITY STREET 085844

347 Pipe Cleaners - Creativity Street [#1271011] --- Bag Standard $0.63 PK 100 GENERAL 7112A

348 Pom Poms, Pound of - Colorations [#904297] --- Bag School Specialty $6.29 EACH CREATIVITY STREET 085935

349 Canvas Panels - 11x14 - Fedrix [NO SUBS] --- Each WB Mason $1.02 EACH FREDRIX TARA31135

350 Canvas Panels - 9x12 - Fedrix [NO SUBS] --- Each WB Mason $0.74 EACH FREDRIX TARA31105

351 Canvas Pads - 12x16 - Sax [NO SUBS] --- Each School Specialty $1.12 EACH SAX 412514

352 Canvas Pads - 9x12 - Sax [NO SUBS] --- Each School Specialty $1.05 EACH SAX 412505

353 Watercolor Paper - Strathmore - 9x12 12 Page Each School Specialty $3.69 EACH STRATHMORE 1588319

354 Scratch Art Paper [Vendor Indicate #pages] --- Each Cascade $5.98 12 pgs scratch art 172494

355 Foam-Core Board - School Smart - 20x30 --- Each School Specialty $10.52 PACK OF 10 SCHOOL SMART 1494871

356 Kneaded Erasers - Large --- Each Standard $0.12 EA EASYERASE 1224

357 Pressed Charcoal 3/Pack Pack

358 Printing Ink - Assorted - Speedball [NO SUBS] 4oz Each

359 Dry-Erase Board, Plain, 9x12, White --- Each School Specialty $0.53 EACH SCHOOL SMART 1528372

360 Compressed Air - Can - Duster 10 OZ Each Cascade $3.25 each cascade 030162

361 School Smart Digital Timer - 2 3/4 x 2 3/4 inches --- Each Cascade $1.30 each baumgartens 029011

362 Dry Erase Crayons - Crayola - Assorted - Large 8/PACK Package Standard $0.78 PK LIQUIMARK 86989

363 Dry Erase Black Markers – Blount Tip --- Each Standard $0.22 EA EDGE 509BK

364 Expo Markers – Asst Color Packs 4/Pack Package National Art $2.16 SET EXPO 80074

365 Dust off Wipes (iPad/computer screens) Container Each Quill $2.67 100/cont Quill 16982Q 

366 Velcro Dots Pack Pack Cascade $1.82 80/pk velcro usa 030592

367 Velcro, Roll, Stick Back, White - Velcro [#VEK90082] --- Roll Quill $10.00 Roll Velcro 90082

368 DABnSEAL Envelope Moistener Each Each WB Mason $1.30 EACH Q.PARK QUA46065

369 Great Papers® Gold Foil Value Certificate Seals 100/Pack Pack Quill $6.77 100/Pack Great Papers 119157

370 Organizer – 12-Slot Rub1738583 Each Each WB Mason $59.47 EACH RUBERMAID RUB1738583

371 Brothers P-Touch - Tze-281 - 1/2" Black on White - 0.47x26.2 Each Each

372 Brothers P-Touch - M-281 - 1/2" Black on White Each Each

373 Batteries - AA - Duracell [NO SUBS] 24/Box Box WB Mason $12.94 BX DURA-CELL DURMN1500B24

374 Batteries - AAA - Duracell [NO SUBS] 24/Box Box WB Mason $12.94 BX DURA-CELL DURMN2400B24000

375 Batteries - AA [VENDOR SPECIFY BRAND and PACKAGE SIZE] 24/Box Box Standard $2.85 BX PAIRDEER ALAA

376 Batteries - AAA [VENDOR SPECIFY BRAND and PACKAGE SIZE] 24/Box Box Standard $2.83 BX PAIRDEER ALAAA

377 Classroom Mail Sorter - 18 Slots - Store More [#161674] Each Each

378 Badge Straps with Clip - Advantus AVT5410 100/Box Box Quill $16.38 100/Box Advantus 2621046

379 Refill Staples Type K - Ricoh [#410802] [NO SUBS] Each Each

380 Projector Bulbs - Mitsubishi [#VLT-XD430LP-OEM] [NO SUBS] Each Each Scott $98.00 Each Mitsubishi/APO VLT-XD430LP

No Bid
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