2019-2020 Custodial Supply Winning Bids

Winning

French River Education Center - Co-op Bid

updated #53: 8/21/19

updated #67: 8/28/19

# Category Description/Specifications Vendor Bid Price  Unit Size Brand Order Number
. 1 Ply 4"x4.5" x 1500 roll - 1.75" core - 48rolls/case '
1 |Toilet Paper [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Iltem #1] Mansfield 23339 48 Morcon #020
. . Toilet Tissue White 4.5x3.75" 500 sheet/roll 96/case .
2 |Toilet Tissue [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #2] Simplex $23.25 (o ESSENDANT PPAT020
3 Fl\(l)(ljleés:asg'llj'le'rUTED ITEMS] Mor-Soft Millennium 2 ply Toilet Tissue 750 sheets 48/case Mansfield $32.78 48 Morcon #027
. . Jumbo Roll - 1 ply - 3.5 x 2000 ft. - 12 rolls/case i
4 |Toilet Tissue [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #4] Mansfield $18.26 12 Morcon TJ663APM
Urinal Screens & Blocks SSS Triples 12/case WB Mason $12.42 BX/12 BOARDWALK BWKNUS
Toilet Bowl Cleaner Freedom Il Bowl Cleaner Non Acid 12/32 oz. Mansfield $15.30 12 Simoniz Freedom
7 Toilet Bowl Swab with Toilet Bowl Swab with Squeegee Tube - Impact 3600 - each Hillyard $1.51 each Impact 3600
Squeegee Tube
8 [Wax Bags - Sanitary Napkins |9 x 10.5 inch - specify number per box WB Mason $15.19 CT/500 HOSPECO HOS260
- White 2 ply 100 sheets/box-30/case
9 |Facial Tissue [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #9] WB Mason $11.49 CT/30 SILKY CSWT1002P30
10 |Floor Stripper- non rise Buckeye Ripsaw Floor Stripper - 5 Gallon Box WB Mason $22.69 EA/5 National Chemical Labs NCL105020
11 Floor Stripper- non rise Enforcer No Rise Wax Stripper - SSS 48109 - 2/2.5 gal per NO BID
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] [case
Floor Stripper . . . ' . .
- 20.97 5gal S Rel
12 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Simonize Release - 5 Gallon Pail Mansfield S ga imoniz elease
13 [F’\'fg)rsﬁgﬁﬁrUTED Ems |Fash 85 Floor Stripper - Pioneer - AMDS16FS - 5 Gallon WB Mason | $65.24 cs/s PIONEER AMNS16FS
14 |Stripping Pad 19" Stripping Pad - specify units per case WB Mason $9.65 CT/5 ACS ACS7219
15 [S’\tlgpgg]g;ﬁgu_rED ITEMS] 20"Americo - case Mansfield $12.11 5 Americo 400120
Stripping Pad " .
- 29.14 CS/5 3M 70071165362
16 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 20" 3M 7200 - 5/case Hillyard $ /
17 |Floor Finisher Omni Guard Floor Finish - Pioneer - AMN141FS - 5 Gallon | WB Mason | $69.33 cs/s PIONEER AMN141FS
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] '
Floor Cleaner
- - - 31.78 EA/5 BETCO BCC6700500
18 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] BETCO - Best Scrub - BCC6700500 - 5 Gallon WB Mason $ /
19 |Floor Cleaner BETCO - Fastdraw 1 PH7 Ultra - 17847-00 - WB Mason $67.29 CT/4 BETCO BCC1784700
Box of (4) 2 Liter Containers
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# Category Description/Specifications Vendor Bid Price  Unit Size Brand Order Number
Floor Cleaner
20 3:1 Floor 24H CI - 3M - #4WK26 NO BID
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 001 eaner
21 |Floor Polish Gelcon Polish - Essential Industries - 207FR - 2 Quarts/Case NO BID
22 |Floor Wax 25% Solid Castleguard Metal Cross Linked Floor Finish - 5-gallon box Mansfield $44.22 Sgal Simoniz Megashine
23 Floor Wax Wet Look Floor Wax Plus - Simonize - CSO750 - 5 gallon Mansfield $35.87 Sgal Simoniz Wetlook
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 9 ' &
24 |Wax Sta-Brite Square Pail - 5 gallon pail WB Mason $55.56 CT/2 (2.5G) PIONEER AMN130FS
Gym Finish Super Court HD Gym Finish - BONO - BNWWT7620-55008 -
25 WB M 373.28 EA/5 BONA BNAWT762055008
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] |5 Gallon ason | /
Cleaner
- - - 39.83 EA/1 BONA BNAWM700018187
26 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Super Court Cleaner - BONO - BNAM70001818 - 1 Gallon WB Mason S /
27 |Carpet Shampoo Steam Plus Carpet Shampoo - gallon - specify units/case Vacuum Store| $17.00 1 gal Steam Plus dsc-42013
Carpet Shampoo .
- - - NO BID
28 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Automatic Shampoo - SSS - 48007 - 4 Gallons/Case
29 | Hand Sanitizer 1000 ml - 6/case - includes dispenser at no charge WB Mason $31.71 cs/6 National Chemical Labs NCL044557
30 [Foaming Hand Soap 1000 ml - 6/case - includes dispenser at no charge WB Mason $25.09 Cs/6 National Chemical Labs NCL043157
Foaming Hand Soap
31 Kutol - Kut686L05 - 6/ WB M 26.49 CT/6 KUTOL KUT686L05
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMs] [~ "™ case ason | 5 /
Foaming Hand Soap
- - - 26.49 CT KUTOL KUT69041
32 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 1000ML - Kutol - KUT69041 - case WB Mason $ /
Hand Sanitizer
33 Purell - GOJ0215608 - h WB M 60.69 EA/1 GOJO G0J215608CT
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] | ¢ eac ason | 5 /
Hand Sanitizer
- - - - - 49.39 CT/2 GOJO GO0J190402CT
34 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Purell - 1200mI-LTX - GOJO-1904- 2/pack WB Mason $ /
35 [Hand Sanitizer Purell NXT - Refill - Pur2137-12 - 12/case NO BID
36 |Disinfectant Betco Fastdraw 2 AF79 - Con - #33147-00 - WB Mason | $57.20 c1/4 BETCO BCC3314700
4-2 Liter Bottles per case
37 |Lysol Spray Disinfectant 19 oz. - 12/case WB Mason $28.97 CS/12 National Chemical Labs NCL2003
Pine Sol . .
. NO BID
38 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 144 oz. Lemon or Orange Cleaner specify units per case
39 |Bleach Gallon - specify units/case and Brand Bid Vacuum Store| $52.00 ciigttzzlge Green Kleen GK-BLCDT6.55
39 [Bleach Gallon - specify units/case and Brand Bid WB Mason $10.49 |CT/6 (liquid)| KIK CUSTOM PRODUCTS KIK11008635042
Professional Pot and Pan
40 |Detergent Dawn - 57445ct - 4/case Mansfield $62.72 4/1gal Dawn 02613
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
41 |Glass Cleaner 19 oz. aerosol can WB Mason $2.09 CS/12 National Chemical Labs NCL2002
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# Category Description/Specifications Vendor Bid Price  Unit Size Brand Order Number
42 |Glass Cleaner 1 Liter - 3M - #4eb95 NO BID
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
Multi Cleaner . .
- - - - NO BID
43 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] 2 Liter - Multi Cleaner - Heavy Duty - 3m - #2u674
44 Cleaner Pretreat Concentrated Extract - SSS - 48070 - 4 Gallon/case NO BID
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
Cleaner Betco Fastdraw 10 - Citrus Chisel - #16747-00 -
55.31 CT/4 BETCO BCC1674700
45 | INO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] |4 Gallons/case WB Mason | 5 /
46 |Clorox Wipes 75/container WB Mason $23.76 CT/6 CLOROX CLO15949CT
Disinfectant Wipes - Lemon
47 |Scented Clean Cut - 372-20006-00 - 6/case NO BID
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
Detergent Disinfectant
- - NO BID
“8 ||No SUBSTITUTED ITEMs]  |PC Plus 2- 13409 - Case
#11 Dual Blend Sha-Zyme ) .
49 NCL-508124 - 4/case WB Mason 45.43 CS/4 Nat| I Ch | Lab NCL508124
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] $ / ational Chemical Labs
#3 Dual Blend Earth Sense
50 |Bathroom Cleaner NCL-507324 - 4/case WB Mason $51.92 CS/4 National Chemical Labs NCL507324
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
#4 Dual Blend Neutral
51 |Cleaner NCL-507424 - 4/case Supreme $91.11 4/cs NCL 507424
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
#19 Dual Blend Disinfectant
52 |Cleaner - Lavender NCL-508924 - 4/case WB Mason $72.16 CS/4 NATIONAL CHEMICAL LABS NCL508924
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
24"x 32", 1 ml - 500/case
53 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #53] Interboro $30.48 1000/Case INT-2432-Reg As Per Sample #53
38" x 58" 2 ply, 2 ml -100/case
. . 14. 1 2
54 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #54] Central Poly $14.40 00/Case Central Poly CP38582M
Trash Bags 38x60 - 2ML Trash Liner - Central Poly - CP38602M
55 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Iltem #55] Central Poly »20.60 100/Case Central Poly CP38602M
33" x 39" 1.5 ml -100/case
. . 1 1 - -X-
56 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid ltem #56] Interboro $8.14 00/Case INT-3339-X-Hvy As Per Sample #56
57 |Trash Bags 33" x 40" 16 mic Liner Natural 250/case Interboro $13.98 | 250/Case INT-3340-H As Per Sample #57

[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Iltem #57]
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# Category Description/Specifications Vendor Bid Price  Unit Size Brand Order Number
24"x 33", 8 mic - 1000/case
’ . . 14. 1 2
58 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #58] Central Poly $14.00 000/Case Central Poly CP243308
40"x48" 16 mic - 250/box
. . 17.2 2 - -
59 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #59] Interboro $17.24 50/Case INT-4048-Hvy As Per Sample #59
Heavy Duty 32 gal. 30" x 37" -500/case
60 |Trash Bags [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #60] Interboro $15.48 500/Case INT-3037-Hvy As Per Sample #60
61 :gg;r:;g Sponges - Green g, 20/box WB Mason | $10.86 CT/20 BOARDWALK BWK174
62 |Stripping Pads - Black 3M - 3M08275 - 5/case WB Mason $7.99 CT/5 ACS ACS7217
63 |!ce Melt- Low Damage 50 pounds - bags Mansfield $7.78 50# Blank Ind. Storm50
Vegetation
64 |IcC Melt - Purple Flame - 50 Ibs. - SSS - CS531 Supreme $860 | 50Ibba 555 SI-IM07
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] P ' P ' 8
65 |Powder Free Non Latex Gloves [100 pair/box - 10 boxes/case Hillyard $3.53 100/BOX Akers V420l
66 |Powder Free Non Latex Gloves [101 pair/box - 10 boxes/case Size XXL Hillyard $3.53 100/BOX Akers V42241
67 |Paper Towels - Natural Baywest # 31300 - 6 rolls/800 ft. - NOTCHED WB Mason $20.99 cT/6 ALLIANCE ALICDZNKS00
[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #67]
68 |Paper Towels - Natural 8" x 600" roll -2" core - 12/case - NOT NOTCHED Mansfield $24.13 12 Morcon P-726N
[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #68]
69 |Paper Towels 8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT NOTCHED . Mansfield $14.36 6 Morcon P-728
[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #69]
70 |Paper Towels - White 8" x 800 roll - 6/case - NOT NOTCHED _ WB Mason $17.72 cT/6 MARCAL MRCP708B
[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #70]
Paper Towels Bounty - 2 ply - 8/pack
. . 12.81 E BLE
"1 |[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]  |[Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid ltem #71] | VB Mason | $128 c1/8 PROCTER & GAM PGC74680
72 St.andard Paper Towel 2 in. core - for 625' roll WB Mason $10.00 EA/1 SOFIDEL HVN410204
Dispenser w/Lever
73 |Neutral Cleaner 2.5 Gallon Containers Hillyard $6.91 Gallon Hillyard 14406
74 |Peroxide Cleaner NCL 4072-35 H202 #2 Multi-surface 4 x 1cs WB Mason | $84.63 cs/a National Chemical Labs NCL407235

[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS]
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# Category Description/Specifications Vendor Bid Price  Unit Size Brand Order Number
Peroxide Cleaner .
- . . 47.44 CS/4 Nati | Chemical Lab NCL407835
75 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] NCL 4078-35 HD #8 Det. & Disf. 4 x 1cs WB Mason S / ational Chemical Labs
Degreaser - . .
- - - NO BID
76 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Kaivac Kalplow - Kaival - KDG - Case
77 |SprayBuff compound 1 Gallon container (4 per case) Mansfield $30.74 4/1gal Simoniz Maintainer
78 |Glass Cleaner 1 Gallon container (4 per case) WB Mason $92.65 cs/4 National Chemical Labs NCL250129
79 |Mop Blue/White Finish Wet Mops WB Mason $15.97 cs/4 National Chemical Labs NCL130429
Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x24 - each
. . 27.52 LUE
80 |Mop [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Iltem #80] WB Mason 5275 c1/6 PUR VALU PRVV04470
Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x36 - each
81 |Mop [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #81] WB Mason 2749 EA/L BOARDWALK BWK1324
Dry Mop Head Looped - 5x48 - each
. . 10.1 EA/1 BOARDWALK BWK1
82 |Mop [Sample Required - Please clearly mark as Bid Item #82] WEB Mason 210.15 / ° 336
83 |Industrial Web Foot Wet Mop |24 oz - 12/pack Hillyard $47.04 12/cs Hillyard 24986
Gloves - Powder Free i
-M - 2. BX/1 AFE GUARD WNGPPFGM
84 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Nitrile - M - 100 pack WB Mason $2.99 /100 SAFE GU CSWNGPPFG
Gloves - Powder Free _
Nitrile -LG -1 k WB M 2.99 BX/100 SAFE GUARD CSWNGPPFGL
85 |no sussTITUTED TEMS]  |Ntfie - LG - 100 pac ason > /
Gloves - Powder Free _
- - 2.99 BX/100 SAFE GUARD CSWNGPPFGXL
86 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Nitrile - XLG - 100 pack WB Mason S /
87 |Gloves - Powder Free LG - 100 pack Interboro $1.84 100/Box Med Pride-Lrg-VPFG As Per Sample #87
88 |Gloves - Powder Free XLG - 100 pack Interboro $1.84 100/Box Med Pride-XL-VPFG As Per Sample #88
89 |Plastic Spray Bottles 320z - plastic spray bottles - each WB Mason $0.41 EA/1 TOLCO TOL120125
90 [Plastic Spray Bottles 320z - trigger spray bottles - each WB Mason $0.41 EA/1 TOLCO TOL110246
Rest Room Cleaner . . .
91 Kaivac Kaiblooey Restroom Cleaner - KBLG - Case Simple 76.00 cs KAIVAC CBK205
[NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] vac Raiblooey Impiex 2
Brute Dolly - Black .
92 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Rubbermaid - RCP640 WB Mason $27.65 EA/1 RUBBERMAID RCP264000BK
Lobby Dust Pans .
93 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Rubbermaid - RCP2531 WB Mason $10.40 EA/1 RUBBERMAID RCP253100BK
Bleach .
94 [NO SUBSTITUTED ITEMS] Rubbermaid - RCP6374 WB Mason $4.66 EA/1 RUBBERMAID RCP637400BLA
95 |HAND SOAP Natl Chem Lab #0431-57 -Afia foaming -NO SUB WB Mason $25.09 Cs/6 National Chemical Labs NCL043157
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