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CRYSTALWARE SCAJD3I0B 1B (7x13)
1 Napkins Lo-Fold #663 10x12 8000/case Casa 8 44 Morcon P-500 17.94 780.36 | CSWLFN1P128000 18.30 805,20 | ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 1 24/334ct 41.79 1838.64
KIMBERLY CLARK
2 Mapkins Cartridge Napkin Case 5250 10 KC 98905 46.02 450,20 KCCOBI08 40.01 400.10 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Napkins Express Napkin - White Cage 500 15 Marcon 4500¥N 32,62 489.30| TORK TRKDX800 421 63.15|SAME ITEM, SOLD AS 6000/CS @ $50.52 SCA/DXS00 63.85 957.68
4 Napkins Express Napkin - Natural Case 500 42 Mcrcon 5000VN 30.88 1296.96 | TORK TRKDX808E 4.05 470.10| SAME ITEM, SOLD AS 6000/CS @ $48.57 SCA/DXI0EE 69.83 203285
Brown Kraft Napkin for Tork Dispenser
5 Napkins #DX906E Case BM 40 Morcon 5000VN 30.88 1235.20| TORK TRKDX906E 48.57 1942 80 SCAIDXI06E 69.83 278319
3 Cups 7 oz. clear Case 2500 7 Dart 7N25 37.12 250.84]DART DCCY7 34.02 238.14 DartiY7 57.16 400,14
7 Cups Dart - 8 oz. - Foam Case 1M 12 Carl 8J8 2174 260.52|DART DCCBJR 19.80 238.80 Dart/85J12 52.88 634.58
8 Cups Dart - 10 0z. - Foam Case 1 10 Dart NT10 27.64 276.40|DART DGGO10HG 17.50 175.00|SAME ITEM; SOLD AS 40/PK @ $0.70 Dart/10J10 43.10 430.98
9 Cug Lids For Dart - 10 oz. - Foam Case 1M 7 Dart 10JL 15.97 111.79| DART DCCAGL 14.64 102,48 Dart/0JL 24.91 174,38
FABRI-KAL
10 Cup Lids Lid LGC1220F Fiat fid -ne slot Case ™ 14 Fabrikal LGC1220F 33.41 467.74|FABLGC1220 32.08 449.12 N Bid No Bid Na Bid
11 Cups Dart - 12 0z, -Foam Case 1M 10 Dart NT12 30.80 308.00|DART DCC12.J12 28.23 282.30 Dart!1 2012 46.36 463.59
12 Cup Lids For Dart - 12 oz. - Foam Case 1M [ Dart 121 17.78 142.24 [DART DCCH12JL 16.30 130.40 Dart/12JL 27.74 221.89
Greenware @ oz, old fashioned clear cup
13 Cup GCYOF Case ™ 3 Fabrikal GC90F 5577 1784.64 | FABRI-KAL FABGCSoF 55.14 1764.48 Fabrikal/NCOOF 77.33 2474.50
14 Cup Lids Lifftock lid 6-10 oz #DCCHFTL Case 1M 7 Dart 8JL 15.77 110.39]DART DCCEFTL 14.45 101.15 Dast/BFTL 24.59 172.14
15 Smoolhie Cup 16 oz Smoothie Cup #NC168 Case 1M 26 Fabrikal NC16S 47.89 1245.14|DART DCCTP16DCT 53,22 1382.72 Vintage/\V1640CC-16 68.50 1781.12
16 Smaogthie Cup Lids Dome kid for 16 0z Smoothie Cup - item #10 Case 1M i4 Fabrikal DLKC1624 33.18 464.52 |DARY DCCDLR626CT 39.09 547.26 Vinlage/V16400L 44.32 564.43
SCLO
17 Plates Desser plate 5" # SX6SAGE Case 1M 25 Dixie SX8SAGE 31.05 776.25 |SCCMPBJB001CT 34.76 865.00 Salo/MP6 (Symphony) 67.12 1678.04
18 Plales 6" Foam Plate white #DCC8PWCR Case M 14 Dart TH1B 12.45 174.30|DART DCCBPWGR 11.41 155.74 Dart/6PWCR 18.64 260.92
19 Plates 9 inch Foam #9PWQR Case 500 154 Dart 9PWQ 18.31 2810.74 [DART DCCIPWAR 17.57 2705.78 DarySPWCR 19.23 2962.00
20 Plates 9 inch Laminaled Foam Case 500 40 Dart 9PWQ 18.31 732.40 [DART DCCOPWQR 17.57 702.80 Dart/9PWQR 30.91 1236.44
BOARDWALK Solo/MP9 (Symphony)
21 Plates 9" Dinner Plale #UXSSAGE Case 1M 7 Dixie UX9SAGE 63.84 448,88 | BWKDEERIPLT 59.23 414.81 560ct 80.58 282.01
On the Go Gontainer -4 compariment
22 Trays FABRIKAL G564 Case 500 27 Fabrikal GS6-4 55,97 1511.19| FABRI-KAL FABGSB4 55.71 1504,17 Fabrikal/GS6-4 (300ct) 130.52 3523.93
Lid for On the Go Container -4 compartment
23 Tray Lid FABRIKAL LGSE Case 500 27 Fabrikal LGSS 29.56 ' 798.12|FABRI-KAL FABLGSS 26.55 716.85 Fabsikal/LGS6 (300ct) B2.31 2292 31
Gen Fak #10500 5 Compartment Foam -
24 Trays NEE[ SAMPLE Case 500 629 Ecopax ST-8 15.75 9908.75|PACTIV PCTYTHI0500 17.37 10925.73| ALTERNATE BiD FOR ITEM 24 Pactiv/YTH10500SG8X 44.00 27676.20
& Gompanriment Molded Fiber Chinel #22025 GREENWAVE
25 Trays NEED SAMPLE Case 500 409 NP&PC 286105 36.78 15043.02 |GNWOVT023 54.75 22392.75|ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 25, SOLD AS 400/CT @ $43.80 Primeware/TL-15-T 68.27 27923.18
26 Trays Foam Tray 5x8 #1025 Gase 500 50 Genpak TH1025 12.31 §15,50| PACTIV PCTTF10020 25.14 1257.00 CFK/88103 5173 2686 58
BOARDWALK
by Food Tray 2# Food Tray #8352-8702 Case 4/250 108 SQP 8352 18.51 1499.08 [BWK3I0LAG200 23.18 2503.44 SQP/B70Z 30.97 3344.66
BOARDWALK
28 Food Tray 3# Food Tray # 8353-8703 Case 21250 54 SQP 8353 14.31 772.74|BWK30LAG300 14.86 802.44 SQP/E703 22.87 1235.18
29 Dessert Dish Plastic Insert Dessert Dish 5 oz. Case 500 17 WNA 7350/SP 29,57 502.69|50LO SCCSDS 24.45 415 85| ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 29; SOLD AS 1000/CT @ $48.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Compartment Salad/Meal Container Dart
30 Meal Containers VP-729\C51UT3 Case 250 95 Dart Ci8-1023 49.14 4668,30| DART DCCCO0PST3 34.01 3230,95 Dar/C53UT3 119.48 11350.54
Hinged 5" Container C181050,Dart
31 Hinged Containers C20UTI\PXT 505 Case 500 33 Durable CI8-1050 35.38 1167.54| DART DCCC20UTH 44.97 1484.01 Dar/C20UT1 80.40 2653.21
32 Hinged Containers Hinged 6" Contalner CI8-1160C Case 500 69 Durable CI8-1160 35.38 2441.22|DART DCCC5TPSTH 34.56 238464 Dat/C57PST1 55.10 2801.56
Meal Container C18-1023 8x8x3 clear
33 Meat Containers hinged Case 250 3 Dart G18-1023 49.14 1523.34|DART DCCCI0PST1 33.98 1053.38 Dast/CSOPST1 54.34 16584.48
CRYSTALWARE
34 Knives # RKNGSN Plastic Med. Weight Case 1M 116 Summit RFKCSN 5.24 507.84 [CSWKNPPWP1000 5.00 580.00 Merit/MBPMIK-W 9.19 065,73
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CRYSTALWARE
35 Fotks HRFKCSN - Plastic Med. Weight Case 1M 455 Summit RFKCSN 524 2384 20}CSWFPPWP1000 5.00 2275.00 Merit/MBPMF.W 9.19 418025
CRYSTALWARE
36 Sporks Plastic Med. Waight Casa 1M 265 Summit RSPORK 5.24 1388.50] CSWSPKPPWP 1000 5.00 1325.00 DixiefCMP21 18.42 4880.88
CRYSTALWARE
37 Utensit Kils (Teaspoon/Napkin/Straw) # 63028 Case 1M 150 Summit 63028 12,69 1903.50 [CSWTSN100 11.91 1786.50 CCISCHOOLKIT 4511 6766.03
CRYSTALWARE
a8 Utensit Kils (Fork/Spoon/napkin/milk straw) Gase 1M 35 Summil 2369600 12.75 for 500 446.25 | CSWFTTSPPWP500 24.22 847,70/ ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 38; S0LD AS 500/C5 @ $12.11 No Bid No Bid No Big
39 Rolled Utensils #REFROLL3 Case 120 7 WNA Refroll3 60.87 489,09 | FINELINE FNL7730 6.01 42.07|ALTERNATE BID £OR ITEM 39; SOLD AS 1000/CS @ $50.08 #REFROLL3 160.76 1125.20
CRYSTALWARE
40 Teaspoons Medium Weight #RSPGSN Case 1M 351 Summit RSPCSN 524 1839.24|CSWTSPPWP1060 5.00 1755.00 Meril/MBPMT-W 9.19 3224.76
TRYSTALWARE
41 Soup spoons Medium Weight # RSOUPCSN Case 1M 45 Summil RSOUPCSN 5.24 235.80|CSWSSPPWP1000 5.00 225.00 MeritMBPMSS-W 9.18 41343
CRYSTALWARE
42 Straws Wrapped 24/500- 5.75" Gase 12M 48 Summit STRAWES 24.75 1188.00{ CSWSMCIWR24500 26.29 1261,92 Choice/dBSWISWH 64.48 3095.34
CRYSTALWARE
43 Straws Wrapped 24/500 - 7.75 Case 12M 7 Summit STRAW25 34.98 244.86] CSWSJIRC24500 34.7% 243.53 Merit/393 (24/400) 60.13 42093
44 Juice Cups Solo 5 oz. Plastic Case 2500 46 Dart 5N25 29.56 4950.96 |DART DCCYSCT 28.35 1871.10 Da/Y5 49.20 3247.08
45 Soufflé Cups Sols - 6 oz, Plastic Case " 2500 29 Dart P550N 40.27 4167 83| DART DCCS50PC 44.13 1279.77 Merit/S550 (5.502) 53.65 1555.95
46 Souflé Cups Solo - 4 oz. Plastic Case 2500 135 Darl P400N 29.51 3983.85|DART DCCA0CPC 234.01 4591.35 Merit/S400 48.12 6496.31
47 Souffié Cup Lids Solo - 4 oz Plastic Case 2500 58 Dart PL4N 20.66 119828 | DART DGCPL4N 18.94 1060.64 Mesit/SL345 40.99 237721
48 Soufflé Cups Sola - 2 0z. Flastic Case 2500 85 Dart P200N 18.15 1542 75| DART DCC200PC 21.19 1801.15 Mesit/S200 31.54 2680.64
49 Souffté Cup Lids Solo 2 oz. Plastic Case 2500 49 Dart PL2N 16.32 799.68| DART DCCPL200N 14,96 733.04 Merit/SL200 30.85 1511.78
50 Squat Cups Dart 6 oz. Foam Case M 145 Dart 6512 30.77 4461.66|DART DCCESJ12 29,52 428040 Dar#65J12 (Non Squat) 50.22 7281.53
51 Squat Cups Dart 8 0z, Foam Case HY) 88 Dart 8512 33.9% 2305.88 | DART DCGESJ12 31.08 211344 Dar/8SJ12 (Non Sguat) 52.88 3585.97
52 Squal Cup Lids Dart (6/8 0z.) Case 1M 30 Dart 12JL 17.78 . 533.40|DART DCC12JL 16.30 489.00 Dart/12JL 27.74 832.10
53 Squal Cups Dart 12 oz, Foam Case M 13 Dart 12520 25.05 for 500 325.65|DART DCC125J20 45.92 596.96|SAME ITEM, SOLD AS 500/CT @ 22,96 Dari/128420 29.06 507.84
54 Squat Cups 24 oz. styro #24MJ48 Case 500 9 Dart 24MJ48 50.38 453.42| DART DCC24MJ48 48.53 436.77 Darti24.J16 {Non Squal) 52.34 471.00
55 Squat Bowls Dari 8 oz. Foam Case 1M 15 Dart 8820 40.74 §11.10|DART DGCEB20 37.34 560.10 Dar/8s.J20 54.60 959.04
10-12 oz foam bowl-white-125/pk
56 Foam Bowl #DCC12BWWCR Case 8pksicarton i6 Dart 12BWWC 17.05 272.60| DART DCC1ZBWWCR 15.63 250.08 Dart/{2ZBWWCR 23.92 382.75
.aminated bowl 5-6 oz - white
57 Bowl #DCCSBWWQ Pack 125/0k 7 Dart SBWWC 11.63 81.41|DART DCCEBWWQ 20.07 203.49 Darl/SBWWC (5 oz) 16.96 118.74
GREENWAVE
58 Bowl Burrito Bowl 24 oz Fiber BO-SC-UBBS Case 400 7 World Centric BO-SC-UBBS 44.63 312.41|GNWB422684 66.70 466.90 | ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 58; SOLID AS 200/CT @ $33.35 CCI/BLB-24 (200ct) 45.56 318.91
Roll Burs Cover 1826 Sullable for food INTEPLAST GROUP Eikay/BORZ1635
59 Plastic Caver usage Case 200 i3 Handgards A3% 12.30 159.90|1BSBP21635 23.00 299.00 21x6x35 29.05 377.61
INTEPLAST BROUP EkaylBOR2 1635
60 Plastic Cover Bun Covers 16 x 6 x 35 Case 200 26 Handgards A35 12.30 319.80|IBSBP21635 23.00 598.00 21x6x35 29.06 755.23
HAOFFMASTER
61 Plastic Cover Plastie Roli Gover -White - 40x300 #ROSTC|{ Roll 200 7 Hofimaster ROSTC 11.67 #1.69|HFM114000 11.61 8127 Hoffmaster!114000 17.62 123.32
BRIMESCURCE
62 Rack Cover Plastic 52" x 80" rol Case 50/case 16 Handgards RC-80 11.84 189.44| PME75001750 15.88 25408 CCISL-528515 16.98 271.63
INTEPLAST GROUP
63 Plastic Wrap 12" with cutling adge Roll 2M 39 WPI 910 8.24 321.36|IBSFSW1202K 7.22 28158 AEP/ZIP12X2CC 16,50 643.36
INTEPLAST GROUP
64 Plastic Wrap 18" with cutling edge Roll 2M a1 WPI 914 11.88 1079.26 | |IBSFSW1B0ZK 10.41 947.31 Western Plastics!1B2Z 21.74 1978.17
CRYSTALWARE
65 Foil 18" Standard- NEED SAMPLE Roll 500° 10 Durabie 1803 17.92 479.20| CSWF18560SD 12.89 128.90 AdvantagelA264 26.22 262.23
CRYSTALWARE
66 Foil Heavy Duly 18 x 500-NEED SAMPLE Roll 500° 79 Durable 51807 23.63 1866.77 | CSWF18500HD 16.08 1270.32 Advantage/A257 33.66 2659.35
Pop up Foi Sheels t2x 11 #720-NEED CRYSTALWARE Western Plastics/633
&7 Foil Sheets SAMPLE Rall 1200 40 Durable 720 52.23 for 2400 2089.20| CSWFPU12103000 18.76 750.40[ALTERNATE BID FOR {TEM 67; SOLD AS 3005/CS @ $46.96 {12200} 89.76 35%0.50
66 Patly Paper Patly paper 4 75X 5 W-4 Case 2400 7 Durable W-44 82.87 for 24K 580.09 | DIXIE DXE434S 9.84 68.88 | ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 68; SOLD AS 1006/BX @ 4.10 Dixif512 (24/1000ct) 124.71 872.04
GENERAL LINE BPGT62-1 (16 3/6 x 24
60 Parchment Paper 18x26 Light Weighl-Unireated Case iM 133 Durable LO10 31.26 4157 58| GENPANLINER 30.58 4067.14 318) 50.19 6675.05
Handgards SBS.5 with Flip top - Clear - Rofson/RSGG78 (No
TH Sandwich Bags 2000/Case widouble saddle Case 2M 74 Handgards SB8.5 9.28 586.72 | LADOAWN LDDS70% 6.92 512.08 Saddle) 20.27 1499.80
Handgards OH-8 Clear - 2000/case w/double; ELKAY
71 Hot Dog/Grinder Bags saddle Case 2M 10 Handgards HD-8 14.93 149.30 | ELKDP5258HDG 10.10 101.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
BOARDWALK
72 Tray 172 Ib. (Nacha) Wax-Lined Case iM 59 SQP 8350 12.39 731.01 | BWK3IOLAGOSD 15,31 903.29 SQP/BT08 21.94 1294.57
BOARDWALK
73 Tray 1 lo. (Nacho} Wasx-Lined Case 1M 70 SQP 8351 16.54 1157.80{ BWK30LAG 100 18.94 1325.80 SQPIB701 26.67 1796.85
74 Pizza Bax Pizza Box #135997 Case 50 7 Mt Tom 135997 8.94 62.58]NC BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
CRYSTALWARE HospecoP150L
75 Gloves Disposable Serving Glove -all sizes Case 1M 33 Salety Zone Plyver-(size) {4.34 for 1000 143 22 | CSWPESHD1010%00 3.25 107.25| SAME ITEM; SOLD AS 10000/CS @ $32.50 (500/Bx) 5.10 168.17
Food Handler unpowdered focd prep glave - CRYSTALWARE
76 Gloves vinyl - all sizes-NEED SAMPLE Case 1™ 557 Summit Vseries 14.45 8048,65| CSWVGPCPFGS 16.40 9134,80| ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 76; SOLD AS 100/BX @ $1.64 Tronex/3980 31.89 17760.72
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77 Gloves Rubber Gloves - elhow length - all sizes Box 12 paftfbox 7 Safety Zone 264-size 5.68 39.76|AKERS AKRH101B 4.64 32, 48{SAME I1TEM, SOLD AS 144PR/CS @ $55.68 Impact/8425# 49 64 347 45
CRYSTALWARE

78 Gloves Blue nitril glove GNPR-XL-1M powder free Case 1M 55 Safety Zone GNPR-XL 39.03 2146.65| CSWNGPPFGXL 3040 1672.00{ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 78; SOLD AS 100/BX @ $3.04 Tronex/9250 40.91 2250.25
CRYSTALWARE

79 Hair Nets 144/Box Box of 18 144/box 27 Disco DPLW22BR 7.88 242.75|CSWSHN22BR 1440 6.65 179.55| SAME ITEM, SOLD AS 10/1440/CS @ $66.50 Keystone/1091B 15.00 404.91
LEGACY BRANDS

80 Towels Chix Wipes Case 900 52 MDI 8506WIPE 43.68 2271.36|LGCP1WE4100 48.59 2531.88|ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 80; SOLD AS 200/CT @ $10.82 Chix/8508 (11x24) 125.81 654227

31 Towels Terry Bar Towel 16" #313sp30 Doz 52 Kitradge 3130SP30 10.41 541.32 [WINCO WNCBTW30 4.03 209.56 Textile/27058 60ct 29.98 165891
HOFFMASTER Hoffmasterid 108-W

82 Tablecloth Tablecloth- White S4x 104 Casa 25 15 Hofimaster 17507 33.05 495 75|HFM210130 30.53 457.95 (64x108) 47.33 710.02

Trash Liners 24 x 33,5 mic, HERITAGE BAG

83 Trash Liners HHERZ4833RNRO1 Casa M 7 Berry YLH24338 15.29 107.03|HERZ4833RNRO1 16.38 114.66 CCU243306CLR 18.43 128.03
HERITAGE BAG

84 Garbage Bags 45 gal. Clear, med. Weight Case 250 11 Berry HCXL4814 18.21 200.31 |[HERVBL4GMNRO1 15.85 171.05 CCI404816CLR 30.43 334.73
HERITAGE BAG

85 Garbage Bags 38" x 58" 1.5 mil thick, item #PG6-6171 Case 100 195 Trinity PG6-6171 17.27 3367.65|HERX7658AK 20,96 4087.20 CCI3858X15BRL 2528 4928.85

88 Pan Pals/Liners Full Size 6 in. deep 34 x 18 Elkay PL2418 | Case 200 30 Handgards 22PL3418 13.89 541.71[ELKAY ELKPVL3418 58.08 2265.12|ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 86; .8MIL, SOLD AS 100/CS @ $20.04 |Elkay/PTL3418 (200/Cs) 134.84 5258.77

23 x 14 Half Pan 4-6 in. deep ELKAY CaymarkfiT {14261

87 Par Pals/Liners PL2314 Case 1000 29 Handgards 22PL2314 14.26 413.54|ELKAY ELKPVL2314 147.30 4271.70[ALTERNATE BID FOR ITEM 87; .BMIL, SOLD AS 180/CS @ $14.73  [24x18x24 500ct 78.74 2283.47
DURC BAG

88 Lunch Bags #3 Case 2M 19 AJM 8B 47.62 904.78|BAGGKS500 48.72 925,68|SAME ITEM; SOLD AS 500/BD @ § 12.18 Duro/B-K #8 500/Cs 16.60 3547
DURGBAG

89 Kraft Bags #6 Case 41500 91 AJM BB 40.07 3646,37 | BAGGKE500 39.60 3603.60 | SAME ITEM; SOLD AS 500/8D @ $9.96 Durof6-K #6 500/Cs 14.37 $307.74

90 Food Bags Reddi Brand 6 x 3 x 12 Case 1M 47 Elkay P6412 11.73 551.31 |ELKAY ELK7G063012 10.34 485,98 Elkay/7G063I012 17.60 827.34

ZiplocTeBaa8E (77 51
91 Bags Ziploc Bags 6" x 8" Case 1M 7 Elkay 021-0808 2062 144,34 LADDAWN LDD3610A 14.24 99.68 509ct 39,79 278.55
Elkay/F210136 {10%32)

92 Bags Ziploc Bags 8" x 10" Case 1M 8 Elkay 21-2P10 20.64 237.12| LADDAWN LDG3635A 22.74 181.92 250ct 20.85 167 .61

g3 Bags Ziploc - galion size Case 1M 48 Eikay 3088 48,27 2316.96 | LADDAWN LDO3GESA 33.07 1587.36 Ziploc/68227 {250ct) 32.48 1559,20

94 Bags Storage Bags - 2 gailon size 13x15 Case 1M 7 Elkay ZIF1315 77.31 541,17 |LADDAWN LDD3675A 51.66 361,62 ZiplociB82253 {100ct) 34.49 241.45
BRILLO

95 Pad Britlo #5P121 Sox of 10 120 45 Biilio 29.99 1349 55 [PUXW240000CT 29.39 1322.65 Srillo/24000 43.21 1944.63
PRIMESOUREE

96 Pad Stainless Steel Kurly Kate 12 pack 72 44 Pagific 756KK 26.97 1486 .68 [PME75004291 18.23 802,12 ACSI434PB 5.28 232.55

NOTES: Item 66 can be ordered from either vendor, per vote of attendees at award meeting 6/11/19. Winning Vendor for each item is BOLDED.

Contact information: W.B. Mason - Dan Langlois, email; |

Lan

lois@wbmason.com, phone number for ordering 1.888.926.2766, fax number for ordering 1.877.721.9160

Contact information: Mansfield Paper - Ken Baker, email: purchasing@mansfieldpaper.com, phone number for ordering 1.413.781.2000, fax number for ordering 1.413.734.9666

NGT CONSIDERED

CNLY BID ITEM #85

_ AMERICAN POLY CHARGES SHIPPING ...




